As-Read Bid Results - Best Value Bid # 2025-08 Fire Dept Uniforms
Due 05/20/25 at 10:00 AM

DISQUALIFIED - NO SAMPLES

DISQUALIFIED - NO SAMPLES DISQUALIFIED - NO SAMPLES

Workout Gear & Duty Uniforms outure Fit Bridal Accessories LLC/DBA BestFit AIteration Uniform Warehouse, Inc. |
Line Item Description Quantity|Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Total \

1 5.11 Tactical Professional short sleeve t-shirt 1 EA $44.99 $44.99 $34.00 $34.00 $27.35 $27.35 $15.50 $15.50
2 5.11 Tactical Professional long sleeve t-shirt 1 EA $59.99 $59.99 S42.00 S42.00 S$31.25 $31.25 $18.35 $18.35
3 Sweatshirt 1 EA $39.99 $39.99 No Bid No Bid $38.76 $38.76 $27.20 $27.20
4 Sweatpants 1 EA $39.99 $39.99 No Bid No Bid $21.93 $21.93 $25.90 $25.90
5 Athletic Shorts 1 EA $39.99 $39.99 No Bid No Bid $25.32 $25.32 $18.40 $18.40
6 Winter Jacket 1 EA $69.99 $69.99 $750.00 $750.00 $320.00 $320.00 $190.00 $190.00
7 Winter Jacket Fleece Liner 1 EA $49.99 $49.99 $198.00 $198.00 $140.00 $140.00 $89.00 $89.00
8 Ball Cap 1 EA $12.99 $12.99 $21.50 $21.50 $23.02 $23.02 $16.90 $16.90
9 Belt 1 EA $12.99 $12.99 $52.00 $52.00 $19.55 $19.55 $19.00 $19.00
10 Tennis Shoes 1 EA $44.99 $44.99 $140.00 $140.00 $120.00 $120.00 $55.00 $55.00
11 Short Sleeve Nomex Shirt 1 EA $44.99 $44.99 No Bid No Bid $120.30 $120.30 $154.00 $154.00
12 Long Sleeve Nomex Shirt 1 EA $59.99 $59.99 No Bid No Bid $151.90 $151.90 $189.00 $189.00
13 Firefighter Rescue Pant 1 EA $49.99 $49.99 No Bid No Bid $151.50 $151.50 $225.00 $225.00
14 Uniform Boots 1 EA $119.99 $119.99 $190.00 $190.00 $101.00 $101.00 $89.00 $89.00

Total $690.86 $1,427.50 $1,291.88 $1,132.25

Class A Uniforms
Line Item Unit of Measure

15 Uniform Shirt, Short Sleeve 1 EA $44.99 $44.99 $54.00 $54.00 $27.55 $27.55 $34.00 $34.00
16 Uniform Shirt, Long Sleeve 1 EA $49.99 $49.99 $58.00 $58.00 $27.98 $27.98 $39.00 $39.00
17 Uniform Coat 1 EA $69.99 $69.99 $215.00 $215.00 $129.55 $129.55 $250.00 $250.00
18 Shoes 1 EA $59.99 $59.99 $190.00 $190.00 $99.00 $99.00 $49.00 $49.00
19 Belt 1 EA $12.99 $12.99 $52.00 $52.00 $19.55 $19.55 $32.00 $32.00
20 Tie 1 EA §7.99 §7.99 $22.50 $22.50 §7.99 §7.99 §7.99 §7.99
21 Bell Cap 1 EA $12.99 $12.99 $92.00 $92.00 $72.00 $72.00 $59.00 $59.00

Total $258.93 $683.50 $383.62 $470.99

5/28/2025 5:28 PM



