
CITY OF UNIVERSITY PARK
BID #13-07, ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR UTILITY PARTS, TABULATION

MUELLER HUGHES FORTILINE AQUA-METRIC A
SHORT UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT. UNIT

ITEM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

POSITIVE DISPLACEMENT WATER METERS - No-Lead/Low Lead Bronze Alloy (NSF/ANSI Standard 61)

1. 5/8 X 3/4” (7.5” lay length) Mueller Systems 91.85$    $91,850.00 94.00$    94,000.00$   No Bid No Bid 102.27$  102,270.00$ 91.74$    
2. 5/8 X 1” (10.75” lay length)  Mueller Systems 168.74$  $168,740.00 157.00$  157,000.00$ No Bid No Bid 170.59$  170,590.00$ 142.69$  

WATER METER INSTALLATION PARTS, VALVES AND FITTINGS - NO LEAD BRASS - ASTM B584-09A

3. 3/4" F/M METER  X  1"M METER MUELLER No Bid No Bid 6.90$      144.90$        13.48$    283.08$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
4. 3/4"MIP X 3/4"METER MUELLER No Bid No Bid 6.40$      320.00$        6.88$      344.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
5. 1"MIP X 1" METER MUELLER No Bid No Bid 9.90$      1,980.00$     10.60$    2,120.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid
6. 90D 3/4"MIP X 3/4"METER MUELLER No Bid No Bid 9.90$      148.50$        10.12$    151.80$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
7. 90D 1"MIP X 1" METER MUELLER No Bid No Bid 14.20$    284.00$        14.44$    288.80$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
8. RESETTER- 5/8" X 3/4". MUELLER No Bid No Bid 63.00$    315.00$        63.45$    317.25$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
9. RESETTER - 1". MUELLER No Bid No Bid 122.00$  1,464.00$     121.15$  1,453.80$   No Bid No Bid No Bid

10. BALL STOP 90D 3/4" CTS X 3/4 MTR MUELLER No Bid No Bid 54.50$    2,725.00$     53.65$    2,682.50$   No Bid No Bid No Bid
11. BALL STOP 90D 1" CTS X 1" MTR MUELLER No Bid No Bid 81.50$    13,936.50$   80.50$    13,765.50$ No Bid No Bid No Bid
12. BALL STOP 90D 3/4"FIP X 5/8" MTR MUELLER No Bid No Bid 47.30$    4,730.00$     48.81$    4,881.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid
13. BALL STOP 90D 1"FIP X 1"MTR MUELLER No Bid No Bid 71.00$    4,260.00$     73.45$    4,407.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid
14. BALL STOP 1-1/2" CTS X 1-1/2" MTR FLG 90D MUELLER No Bid No Bid 169.00$  169.00$        185.72$  185.72$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
15. BALL STOP 2" CTS X 2" MTR FLG 90D MUELLER No Bid No Bid 215.60$  21,560.00$   235.75$  23,575.00$ No Bid No Bid No Bid
16. BALL STOP 3/4"CTS X 3/4" CC THREAD MUELLER No Bid No Bid 33.60$    672.00$        34.20$    684.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
17. BALL STOP 1"CTS X 1"CC THREAD MUELLER No Bid No Bid 44.00$    7,920.00$     44.97$    8,094.60$   No Bid No Bid No Bid
18. 3/4"CTS X 3/4"MIP X 3/4" MIP X 7-1/2". MUELLER No Bid No Bid 27.20$    27.20$          76.92$    76.92$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
19. 3/4"CTS X 3/4"CTS MUELLER No Bid No Bid 12.90$    516.00$        12.91$    516.40$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
20. 3/4"CTS X 1"CTS MUELLER No Bid No Bid 14.30$    143.00$        14.99$    149.90$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
21. 1"CTS X 1"CTS MUELLER No Bid No Bid 14.00$    560.00$        14.76$    590.40$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
22. 1-1/4"CTS X 1-1/4"CTS MUELLER No Bid No Bid 40.50$    243.00$        25.50$    153.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
23. 1-1/2"CTS X 1-1/2"CTS MUELLER No Bid No Bid 50.00$    300.00$        49.40$    296.40$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
24. 2"CTS X 2"CTS MUELLER No Bid No Bid 67.40$    404.40$        66.69$    400.14$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
25. 3/4"CTS X 3/4"MIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 10.50$    105.00$        10.60$    106.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
26. 1"CTS X 1"MIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 12.50$    125.00$        12.55$    125.50$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
27. 1"CTS X 3/4"MIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 12.90$    12.90$          11.58$    11.58$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
28. 1-1/2"CTS X 1-1/2"MIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 34.70$    104.10$        34.38$    103.14$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
29. 2"CTS X 2"MIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 50.60$    3,542.00$     50.09$    3,506.30$   No Bid No Bid No Bid
30. 3/4"IPS X 3/4"MIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 13.00$    13.00$          14.03$    14.03$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
31. 1"IPS X 1"MIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 20.50$    41.00$          20.40$    40.80$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
32. 3/4"CTS X 3/4"FIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 11.40$    456.00$        11.14$    445.60$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
33. 3/4"CTS X 1"FIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 13.20$    26.40$          13.27$    26.54$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
34. 1"CTS X 1"FIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 16.30$    407.50$        15.13$    378.25$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
35. 1"CTS X 3/4"FIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 13.20$    66.00$          13.13$    65.65$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
36. 1-1/4"CTS X 1-1/4"FIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 19.80$    59.40$          27.61$    82.83$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
37. 1-1/2"CTS X 1-1/2"FIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 44.50$    267.00$        43.98$    263.88$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
38. 2"CTS X 2"FIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 53.00$    530.00$        52.37$    523.70$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
39. 1"IPS X 1"FIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 17.90$    53.70$          17.55$    52.65$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
40. 90D 3/4"CTS X 3/4"CTS MUELLER No Bid No Bid 15.80$    395.00$        16.68$    417.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
41. 90D 1"CTS X 1"CTS MUELLER No Bid No Bid 20.40$    612.00$        21.42$    642.60$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
42. 90D 1-1/2"CTS X 1-1/2"CTS MUELLER No Bid No Bid 69.50$    347.50$        68.80$    344.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
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43. 90D 2"CTS X 2"CTS MUELLER No Bid No Bid 140.00$  7,000.00$     139.19$  6,959.50$   No Bid No Bid No Bid
44. 90D 3/4"CTS X 3/4"MIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 11.00$    176.00$        11.60$    185.60$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
45. 90D 1"CTS X 1"MIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 19.00$    190.00$        19.31$    193.10$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
46. 90D 1-1/2"CTS X 1-1/2"MIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 56.80$    170.40$        56.07$    168.21$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
47. 90D 2"CTS X 2"MIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 81.30$    406.50$        80.38$    401.90$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
48. 90D 3/4"CTS X 3/4"FIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 16.20$    324.00$        15.04$    300.80$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
49. 90D 1"CTS X 1"FIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 24.60$    246.00$        24.51$    245.10$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
50. 90D 1-1/2"CTS X 1-1/2"FIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 62.80$    125.60$        62.06$    124.12$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
51. 90D 2"CTS X 2"FIP MUELLER No Bid No Bid 72.40$    144.80$        88.73$    177.46$      No Bid No Bid No Bid

BRASS - NO LEAD - ASTM B584-09A

52. BELL 1/4" X 1/2" BRASS No Bid No Bid 3.10$      6.20$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
53. BELL 1/4" X 3/8" BRASS No Bid No Bid 2.50$      10.00$          No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54. BELL 1/2" X 3/4" BRASS No Bid No Bid 4.70$      47.00$          No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
55. BELL 3/4" X 1" BRASS No Bid No Bid 7.80$      78.00$          No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
56. HEX BUSHING 1.00" X 0.75" BRASS No Bid No Bid 3.90$      39.00$          2.98$      29.80$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
57. HEX BUSHING 2.00 X 1.00" BRASS No Bid No Bid 15.30$    153.00$        11.57$    115.70$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
58. HEX BUSHING 2.00" X 1.50" BRASS No Bid No Bid 12.70$    25.40$          9.60$      19.20$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
59. 3/4" FNPT X 3 BRASS No Bid No Bid 6.00$      30.00$          4.52$      22.60$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
60. 1" FNPT X 3 BRASS No Bid No Bid 10.60$    106.00$        8.03$      80.30$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
61. 1-1/2" FNPT X 3 BRASS No Bid No Bid 20.40$    204.00$        15.50$    155.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
62. 2" FNPT X 3 BRASS No Bid No Bid 33.20$    332.00$        25.40$    254.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
63. 0.75" FNPT BRASS No Bid No Bid 3.90$      39.00$          2.98$      29.80$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
63. 1.00" FNPT BRASS No Bid No Bid 6.00$      60.00$          4.52$      45.20$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
64. 1.50" FNPT BRASS No Bid No Bid 12.50$    125.00$        9.60$      96.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
65. 2.00" FNPT BRASS No Bid No Bid 20.50$    205.00$        15.80$    158.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
66. 90D 3/4" FNPT BRASS No Bid No Bid 4.80$      24.00$          3.68$      18.40$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
67. 90D 1" FNPT BRASS No Bid No Bid 7.40$      37.00$          5.68$      28.40$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
68. 90D 1-1/2" FNPT BRASS No Bid No Bid 14.50$    72.50$          15.68$    78.40$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
69. 90D 2" FNPT BRASS No Bid No Bid 24.00$    120.00$        18.34$    91.70$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
70. 3/4" AWWA TAPER MUELLER CC THREAD MUELLER No Bid No Bid 8.90$      89.00$          5.83$      58.30$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
71. 1" AWWA TAPER MUELLER CC THREAD MUELLER No Bid No Bid 9.50$      95.00$          8.49$      84.90$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
72. 3/4" MNPT W/HXHD BRASS No Bid No Bid 3.70$      18.50$          3.00$      15.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
73. 1" MNPT W/SQU DR BRASS No Bid No Bid 3.70$      18.50$          3.00$      15.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
74. 1-1/2" MNPT W/SQU DR BRASS No Bid No Bid 7.00$      35.00$          5.39$      26.95$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
75. 2" MNPT W/SQU DR BRASS No Bid No Bid 11.00$    11.00$          8.49$      8.49$          No Bid No Bid No Bid
76. 3-1/2" MNPT W/MALE SQU DR BRASS No Bid No Bid 7.70$      7.70$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
77. 3-1/2" MNPT W/FM SQU DR PLUG BRASS No Bid No Bid 7.70$      23.10$          No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78. 4"MNPT W/MALE SQU DR BRASS No Bid No Bid 8.50$      42.50$          No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
79. 4"MNPT W/FM SQU DR BRASS No Bid No Bid 8.50$      85.00$          No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
80. 3/4" NPT X CLOSED BRASS No Bid No Bid 2.00$      200.00$        1.62$      162.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
81. 3/4" NPT X 2" LONG BRASS No Bid No Bid 2.50$      12.50$          2.04$      10.20$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
82. 3/4" NPT X 4" LONG BRASS No Bid No Bid 4.30$      21.50$          3.58$      17.90$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
83. 3/4" NPT X 6" LONG BRASS No Bid No Bid 6.30$      31.50$          5.22$      26.10$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
84. 1" NPT X CLOSED BRASS No Bid No Bid 2.90$      145.00$        2.40$      120.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
85. 1" NPT X 2" LONG BRASS No Bid No Bid 3.50$      35.00$          2.96$      29.60$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
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86. 1" NPT X 4" LONG BRASS No Bid No Bid 6.20$      62.00$          5.18$      51.80$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
87. 1" NPT X 6" LONG BRASS No Bid No Bid 9.00$      90.00$          7.62$      76.20$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
88. 1-1/2" NPT X CLOSED BRASS No Bid No Bid 5.70$      28.50$          4.71$      23.55$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
89. 1-1/2" NPT X 2" LONG BRASS No Bid No Bid 6.20$      62.00$          5.07$      50.70$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
90. 1-1/2" NPT X 4" LONG BRASS No Bid No Bid 11.00$    220.00$        9.08$      181.60$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
91. 1-1/2" NPT X 6"LONG BRASS No Bid No Bid 16.00$    1,600.00$     13.41$    1,341.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid
92. 1-1/2" NPT X 8"LONG BRASS No Bid No Bid 21.50$    107.50$        17.80$    89.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
93. 2"NPT X CLOSED BRASS No Bid No Bid 8.50$      850.00$        7.17$      717.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
94. 2" NPT X 4"LONG BRASS No Bid No Bid 14.20$    1,065.00$     11.68$    876.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
95. 2" NPT X 6" LONG BRASS No Bid No Bid 21.00$    420.00$        17.24$    344.80$      No Bid No Bid No Bid
96. 2" NPT X 8" LONG BRASS No Bid No Bid 28.00$    560.00$        23.00$    460.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid

ESTIMATED ANNUAL TOTAL 45,968.20$   38,616.71$ 
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CITY OF UNIVERSITY PARK
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TLAS
EXT.

PRICE

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

234,430.00$ 
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