Bid #2015-01

UTILITY PARTS - ANNUAL CONTRACT

11/5/2014
B20 & Ferguson
Fortiline Associates HD Supply \Waterworks
PRIMARY EXT
TOTAL $270,306.28 $199,126.57 $_36,000.00 $_13,150.90 $ 22,028.81
SECONDARY /
TERTIARY
EXT TOTAL $ 43,245.70 $ 17,134.46 $ - $ 26,111.24 $ -
| B FERGUSON
Fortiline Associates HD Supply WATERWORKS
EST.
ANNUAL
ITEM# |LOT SHORT DESCRIPTION MANUF. USAGE Unit | EXT. TOTAL ALL ] Price Notes Price Notes Price Notes Price Notes
1 COPPER TUBING 658.88.5K075-100 -- SOFT-K: 3/4 X 100FT ROLL NONE SPECIFIED 400 each | $ 1,400.00 | S 3.50 [34k100 S 3.90
2 COPPER TUBING 658.88.5K100-100 -- SOFT-K: 1 X 100FT ROLL NONE SPECIFIED 2500 each [ $ 11,000.00 | $ 4.40 |1k100 $ 4.75
CAST IRON, NOT
DUCTILE,
WAREHOUSE
NEEDS A
DIFFERENT
3 METER BOX 890.40.18PGMB -- POLY BASE 18 X 15 DI RING & LID W/AMR HOLE B20 300 each | $ 36,000.00 | $ - S 120.00 $ - S 65.88 |QUALITY ITEM
B&H BCF 1324-18
4 METER BOX 890.40.DFW1324B -- POLY BASE 13 X 24 X 18 DEEP DFW PLASTICS 100 each | $ 8,800.00 | $ 88.00 [DFW1324C-18-BODY S 112.31 [BODY S 98.39
B&H BCF 1730-18
5 METER BOX 890.40.DFW1730B -- POLY BASE 17 X 30 X 18 DEEP DFW PLASTICS 50 each | $§ 5,750.00 | $ 115.00 |DFW $ 162.63 [BODY S 120.09
6 METER BOX 890.45.DFW1324C -- POLY 13 X 24 X 18DEEP W/1-AMR LID DFW PLASTICS 50 each | $ 7,250.00 | $ 145.00 S 218.29 |B&H BCF 1324-18 S 159.59
B&H BCF 1730-18
7 METER BOX 890.40.DFW1730C -- POLY 17 X 30 X 18DEEP W/2 AMR LID DFW PLASTICS 50 each | § 9,850.00 | $ 197.00 $ 319.68 |WITH 1 AMR HOLE S 218.27
B&H BCF 1324 SOLID
8 METER BOX 890.40.BH1324DILID -- DI LID 13X24 W/ PLAIN LID BASS-HAYS 100 each | $ 7,800.00 | $ 78.00 S 82.41 [LID S 104.50
B&H BCF 1730 LID
9 METER BOX 890.40.DFW1730L -- DI LID 17X30 W/ 2-ARM HOLES DFW PLASTICS 50 each | § 6,650.00 | $ 133.00 $ 165.76 |WITH 1 AMR HOLE S 150.50
10 METER BOX 890.40.P34PD18 -- 18X18 PLASTIC BOX W/ DI LID AND RING BASS-HAYS 50 each | $ 7,250.00 | $ 145.00 |BASS AND HAYES S 158.00 |B&H P34PD18
CAN NOT BID OMNI
WOULD LOVE TO
HAVE YOU TEST OUR
11 WATER METER 890.44.150C2 - 1.5 OMNI C2 USG 8 WHEEL SENSUS 3 each NO BID ZENNER METERS NO BID NO BID NO BID
CAN NOT BID OMNI
WOULD LOVETO
HAVE YOU TEST OUR
12 WATER METER 890.44.150T2 -- 1.5 OMNI T2 USG 8 WHEEL W/25 ITRON ILC SENSUS 150 each NO BID ZENNER METERS NO BID NO BID NO BID
CAN NOT BID OMNI
WOULD LOVE TO
HAVE YOU TEST OUR
13 WATER METER 890.44.200C2 -- 2 OMNI C2 USG 8 WHEEL SENSUS 5 each NO BID ZENNER METERS NO BID NO BID NO BID
CAN NOT BID OMNI
WOULD LOVETO
HAVE YOU TEST OUR
14 WATER METER 890.44.200T2 -- 2 OMNI T2 USG 8 WHEEL SENSUS 6 each NO BID ZENNER METERS NO BID NO BID NO BID
Need Flange kit
compatible with
Sensus Water Meters
Aqua Metrics is Sole
15 MTR FLANGE 890.45.MF150 -- FLANGE ONLY 1-1/2 SENSUS 150 each S 22.00 [DFW Ditributor S 27.36
Need Flange kit
compatible with
Sensus Water Meters
Aqua Metrics is Sole
16 MTR FLANGE 890.45.MF200 - FLANGE ONLY 2 SENSUS 20 each S 23.00 [DFW Ditributor S 27.04
17 DI BEND 659.17.45D0606 -- (1/8) 6MJ X 6MJ C153 SIGMA 4 each | $ 156.00 | $ 39.00 [STAR FITTINGS S 43.26 S 44.40
18 DI CAP 659.27.TCAPO4 -- PIPE CAP 4MJ C153 SIGMA 1 each | $§ 11.00) S 11.00 S 12.09 S 12.41
19 DI CAP 659.27.TCAP04X02 -- PIPE CAP 4MJ W/2 IP TAP C153 SIGMA 3 each | $§ 69.00 | S 23.00 S 25.12 S 26.99
20 DI CAP 659.27.TCAPO6 -- PIPE CAP 6MJ C153 SIGMA 5 each | $ 96.25 ] $ 19.25 S 21.40 S 22.05
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B20 & FERGUSON
Fortiline Associates HD Supply WATERWORKS
EST.
ANNUAL
ITEM# |LOT SHORT DESCRIPTION MANUF. USAGE Unit | EXT. TOTAL ALL | Price Notes Price Notes Price Notes Price Notes

21 DI CAP 659.27.TCAPOS -- PIPE CAP 8MJ C153 SIGMA 1 each [ $ 320013 32.00 $ 35.35 $ 36.35
22 DI COUPLING 659.33.0606ANC13L - ANCHOR 6PE X 6ANC X 13L C153 SIGMA 10 each | $ 795.00 | $ 79.50 $ 88.37
23 DI COUPLING 659.33.0808ANC12L - ANCHOR 8PE X 8ANC X 13L C153 SIGMA 2 each | $ 2040006  102.00 $ 113.49
24 DI GLAND 659.44.MLD04 -- MEGA-LUG KIT 4W/MJ GSKT & T-BOLTS SIGMA 10 each | $ 238.00 | $ 25.00 |[STAR $ 25.60 $ 23.80
25 DI GLAND 659.44.MLDO6 -~ MEGA-LUG KIT 6 W/MJ GSKT & T-BOLTS SIGMA 50 each | $ 1,458.00 | $ 30.00 $ 31.63 $ 29.16
26 DI GLAND 659.44.MLDO8 -- MEGA-LUG KIT 8 W/MJ GSKT & T-BOLTS SIGMA 20 each | $ 785.00 | $ 41.00 $ 43.13 $ 39.25
27 DI PLUG 659.54.TPLGO4 -- PIPE PLUG 4MJ C153 SIGMA 1 each [ $ 13.00]$ 13.00 $ 14.42 $ 15.50
28 DI PLUG 659.54.TPLGO6 - PIPE PLUG 6MJ C153 SIGMA 1 each [ $ 26.00$ 26.00 $ 28.37 $ 30.85
29 DI PLUG 659.54.TPLGOS8 - PIPE PLUG 8MJ C153 SIGMA 1 each [ $ 39.004$ 39.00 $ 4233 $ 46.03
30 DI PLUG 659.54.TPLG12 -- PIPE PLUG 12MJ C153 SIGMA 1 each [ $ 67.00 | $ 67.00 $ 73.49 $ 80.84
31 DI SLEEVE - CUTIN _|659.73.CI0404PE - 4MJ X 4PE C153 W/O ACC SIGMA 1 each | $ 154.00 | $  154.00 $ 170.23 $ 22411
32 DI SLEEVE - CUTIN _ |659.73.CI0606PE - 6MJ X 6PE C153 W/O ACC SIGMA 7 each | $ 1,155.00 | $  165.00 $ 182.33 $ 227.15
33 DI SLEEVE - CUTIN _ |659.73.CI0808PE -- 8MJ X 8PE C153 W/O ACC SIGMA 2 each | $ 448.00 | $  224.00 $ 247.44 $ 331.00
34 DI SLEEVE - SOLID _ |659.73.5L0412 -- 4MJ X 12L C153 SIGMA 5 each | $ 130.00} $ 26.00 $ 28.84 $ 32.12
35 DI SLEEVE - SOLID _ |659.73.5L0612 -- 6MJ X 12L C153 SIGMA 13 each | $ 572.00 | $ 44.00 $ 48.37 $ 52.60
36 DI SLEEVE - SOLID _ |659.73.5L0812 -- 8MJ X 12L C153 SIGMA 1 each [ $ 7150 | $ 71.50 $ 79.07 $ 88.00
37 DI SLEEVE - SOLID _ |659.73.5L1012 -- 10MJ X 12L C153 SIGMA 1 each [ $ 85.00 | $ 85.00 $ 94.42 $ 106.33
38 DI GATE VALVE 670.75.02T02T -- 2FIP X 2FIP cLow 150 each [ $ 28,950.00 | $ 193.00 |MH VALVES $ 209.73 $ 216.80
39 DI GATE VALVE 670.75.0404 - 4MJ X 4MJ - W/O ACCESSORIES MUELLER 2 each | $ 610.00 | $  305.00 $ 343.58 $ 359.19
40 DI GATE VALVE 670.75.0606 -- 6MJ X 6MJ - W/O ACCESSORIES MUELLER 6 each | $ 2,370.00 | $  395.00 S 438.24 $ 458.16
41 DI GATE VALVE 670.75.0808 -- 8MJ X 8MJ - WO /ACCESSORIES MUELLER 2 each | $ 1,250.00 | $  625.00 S 697.98 $ 721.51
42 DI GATE VALVE 670.75.1010 -- 10MJ X 10MJ - W/O ACCESSORIES MUELLER 1 each | $ 975.00 | $  975.00 $  1,088.27 $ 1,164.20
43 DI GATE VALVE 670.75.1212 -- 12MJ X 12MJ - W/O ACCESSORIES MUELLER 1 each | $ 1,235.00 | $  1,235.00 S 1,377.07 $ 1,407.67
44 CONCRETE RISER __[210.72.02X24 -- MANHOLE RISER/GUIDE RING 2X24 NONE SPECIFIED 32 each | $ 416.00 | $ 13.00 $ 15.73
45 CONCRETE RISER __[210.72.03X24 - MANHOLE RISER/GUIDE RING 3X24 NONE SPECIFIED 32 each | $ 544.00 | $ 17.00 $ 19.93
46 DI SERV SDL 659.73.SDL4X1CC -- SADDLE 4 X 1 CC W/2-55 BANDS DI/C900 ROMAC IND 10 each | $ 351.20 | $ 37.50 $ 35.12 $ 38.46
47 DI SERV SDL 659.73.SDL4X2IP -- SADDLE 4 X 2 IP W/2-55 BANDS DI/C900 ROMAC IND 30 each | $ 1,222.50 | $ 40.75 $ 42.30 $ 46.29
48 DI SERV SDL 659.73.SDL6X1CC -- SADDLE 6 X1CC W/2-55 BANDS DI/C900 ROMAC IND 10 each | $ 403.50 | $ 42.50 $ 40.35 $ 43.16
49 DI SERV SDL 659.73.SDL6X2IP - SADDLE 6 X 2 IP W/2-55 BANDS DI/C900 ROMAC IND 150 each | $ 7,050.00 | $ 47.00 $ 48.36 $ 52.33
50 DI SERV SDL 659.73.SDL8X1CC -- SADDLE 8 X1CC W/2-55 BANDS DI/C900 ROMAC IND 10 each | $ 476.70 | $ 50.00 $ 47.67 $ 51.02
51 DI SERV SDL 659.73.SDL8X2IP -- SADDLE 8 X 2 IP W/2-55 BANDS DI/C900 ROMAC IND 50 each | $ 2,675.00 | $ 53.50 $ 56.28 $ 61.62
52 GRATE 890.00.7262 -- STORMWATER CURB OPENING BASS-HAYS 40 each | $ 3,280.00 | $ 82.00 $ 90.75
53 DI MANHOLE 890.30.75C400S -- COVER SANITARY 24 #400 B&H BASS & HAYS 24 each | $ 4,080.00 | $  170.00 $ 185.15 $ 176.87
54 DI MANHOLE 890.30.75R24400 - RING 24 #400-24A B&H BASS & HAYS 24 each | $ 4,080.00 | $  170.00 $ 184.01 $ 173.78
55 DI MANHOLE 890.30.BH400 -- COVER STORM 24 #400 B&H BASS & HAYS 1 each | $ 170.00 | $  170.00 $ 185.15 $ 176.87
56 DI MANHOLE 890.30.FBRGLSS -- FIBERGLASS MANHOLE 48X5 STD WALL LF MFG 3 each | $ 2,400.00 | $  800.00 |LF MAN#M480506 $ 835.29 $ 946.67
57 DI VALVE BOX 890.40.340-1 - STD.2-PIECE-7-1/4 W/TOP FLANGE BASS & HAYS 175 each | $ 6,125.00 | $ 35.00 [ACCUCAST $ 65.35
58 DI VALVE BOX 890.30.INSERTS - INFLOW PROTECTOR 5 EGW UTILITIES 200 each | $ 2,000.00 | $ 10.00
59 FIRE HYDRANT 340.60.EXT06 - EXTENSION 6 CLOW FH NONE SPECIFIED 6 each | $ 1,200.00 | $  200.00 |HRPI $ 369.51 $ 212.41
60 FIRE HYDRANT 340.60.EXT12 -- EXTENSION 12 CLOW FH NONE SPECIFIED 1 each | $ 230.00 | $  230.00 [HRPI $ 431.49 $ 253.95
61 FIRE HYDRANT 340.60.EXT24 -- EXTENSION 24 CLOW FH NONE SPECIFIED 1 each | $ 294.00 | $  294.00 |HRPI $ 531.96 $ 321.84
62 FIRE HYDRANT 340.60.EXTKIT -- EXTENSION GASKET KIT - W/BOLTS HYD REPAIR PTS 10 each | $ 1,200.00 | $  120.00 |HRPI $ 132.30 $ 216.75
63 FIRE HYDRANT 340.60.HYD36 -- 36 BURY WITH 5-1/4 DAL SPEC STMR NZZL CLOW 4 each | $ 5,600.00 | $  1,400.00 |K81 S 1,586.83 S 1,675.98
64 FIRE HYDRANT 340.60.HYD48 -- 48 BURY WITH 5-1/4 DAL SPEC STMR NZZL CLOW 4 each | $ 5,900.00 | $  1,475.00 |K81 S 1,662.87 $ 1,717.69
65 FIRE HYDRANT 340.60.HYD60 -- 60 BURY WITH 5-1/4 DAL SPEC STMR NZZL CLOW 3 each | $ 4,560.00 | $  1,520.00 |K81 S 1,738.77 $ 1,776.57
66 FIRE HYDRANT 340.60.NIS-BAG -- NOT IN SERVICE BAG-POUCH OF 8 POLLARD 5 each | $ 191.00 | $ - _|NOBID $ 38.20
67 PIPE CLAMP 670.52.5B02X15 -- REPAIR CLAMP 2(2.35-2.63) X 15. FORD 1 each | $ 58.00 | $ 58.00 [FORD $ 74.93 $ 96.51

670.52.5B04X12.5.1CC - REPAIR CLAMP 4(4.74-5.14) X 12-1/2
68 PIPE CLAMP w/1cC FORD 8 each [ $ 568.00 | $ 71.00 $ 101.21 $ 109.95
69 PIPE CLAMP 670.52.5B04X20 -- REPAIR CLAMP 4(4.74-5.14) X 20. FORD 20 each | $ 1,860.00 | $ 93.00 $ 132.91 $ 149.80
70 PIPE CLAMP 670.52.5B04X30 -- REPAIR CLAMP 4(4.74-5.14) X 30. FORD 1 each [ $ 140.00 | $  140.00 $ 176.11 $ 236.11

670.52.5B06X12.5.1CC - REPAIR CLAMP 6(6.84-7.24) X 12-1/2 W/
71 PIPE CLAMP 1CC FORD 10 each | $ 790.00 | $ 79.00 $ 118.48 $ 129.56
72 PIPE CLAMP 670.52.5B06X20 -- REPAIR CLAMP 6(6.84-7.24) X 20. FORD 48 each | $ 5184.00 | $  108.00 $ 167.01 $ 170.99
73 PIPE CLAMP 670.52.5B06X30 -- REPAIR CLAMP 6(6.84-7.24) X 30. FORD 15 each | $ 2,325.00 | §  155.00 $ 238.72 $ 250.40

670.52.5B08X12.5.1CC - REPAIR CLAMP 8(8.99-9.39) X 12-1/2
74 PIPE CLAMP w/1cC FORD 1 each [ $ 86.77] $ 86.77 $ 134.44 $ 141.63
75 PIPE CLAMP 670.52.5B08X20 -- REPAIR CLAMP 8(8.99-9.39) X 20. FORD 4 each [ $ 460.00 | $  115.00 $ 187.68 $ 196.82
76 PIPE CLAMP 670.52.5B08X30 -- REPAIR CLAMP 8(8.99-9.39) X 30. FORD 4 each [ $ 760.00 | $  190.00 $ 277.48 $ 276.72
77 PIPE CLAMP 670.52.5B10X20 -- REPAIR CLAMP 10 (11.04-11.44) X 20. FORD 2 each [ $ 276.00]$  138.00 $ 228.93 $ 246.89
78 PVC PIPE 658.60.2PEC100 -- SDR 9 POLYETHYLENE 2.00 X 100FT NONE SPECIFIED 700 each | $ 945.00 | $ 1.35 $ 1.57
79 PVC PIPE 658.60.04X13 -- SDR35 4 X 14FT NONE SPECIFIED 1800 FT_|$ 1,512.00 | $ 14.00 |SECONDARY $ 14.42 |TERTIARY $ 11.76 [PRIMARY
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B20 & FERGUSON
Fortiline Associates HD Supply WATERWORKS
EST.
ANNUAL
ITEM# |LOT SHORT DESCRIPTION MANUF. USAGE _ |Unit | EXT. TOTAL ALL ] Price Notes Price Notes Price Notes Price Notes
80 PVC PIPE 658.60.06X13 -- SDR35 6 X 14FT NONE SPECIFIED 4500 FT S 8,238.21 1 $ 30.10 [SECONDARY S 31.22 [TERTIARY S 25.63 |PRIMARY
81 PVC PIPE 658.60.08X13 - SDR35 8 X 14FT NONE SPECIFIED 850 FT S 2,796.50 | $ 54.32 [SECONDARY S 56.00 [TERTIARY S 46.06 [PRIMARY
82 PVC PIPE 658.60.10X13 -- SDR35 10X14FT NONE SPECIFIED 140 FT $ 720.90 | $ 85.12 [SECONDARY S 87.92 [TERTIARY S 72.09 |PRIMARY
83 PVC PIPE 658.60.12X13 - SDR35 12X14FT NONE SPECIFIED 14 FT $ 10359 | S 122.36 |SECONDARY S 123.34 | TERTIARY S 103.59 |PRIMARY
84 PVC PIPE 658.60.IPS4X20 -- SDR26 CL160 IPS 4 X 20FT NONE SPECIFIED 80 FT $ 96.76 | $ 28.20 [SECONDARY S 29.60 [TERTIARY S 24.19 |PRIMARY
85 PVC PIPE 658.60.1PS8X20 - SDR26 CL160 IPS 8 X 20FT NONE SPECIFIED 80 FT $ 355.16 ) $ 104.80 |SECONDARY S 108.00 | TERTIARY S 88.79 [PRIMARY
QUOTING DR 14 -
WAREHOUSE NEEDS
DIFFERENT QUALITY
86 PVC PIPE 659.60.C909-04X20 -- C909 CL150 C10D 4 X 20FT ULTRA BLUE JM EAGLE 300 FT $ 599.85 | $ 61.80 [ITEM S 63.80 [SECONDARY S 39.99 |PRIMARY
QUOTING DR 14 -
WAREHOUSE NEEDS
DIFFERENT QUALITY
87 PVC PIPE 659.60.C909-06X20 -- C909 CL150 C10D 6 X 20FT ULTRA BLUE JM EAGLE 600 FT S 2,441.70 ) S 121.00 |ITEM S 124.40 [SECONDARY S 81.39 |PRIMARY
QUOTING DR 14 -
WAREHOUSE NEEDS
DIFFERENT QUALITY
88 PVC PIPE 659.60.C909-08X20 -- C909 CL150 C10D 8 X 20FT ULTRA BLUE JM EAGLE 100 FT S 1,069.00 | S 207.80 [ITEM S 213.80
QUOTING DR 14 -
89 PVC PIPE 659.60.C909-10X20 -- €309 CL150 C10D 10 X 20FT ULTRA BLUE JM EAGLE 40 FT $ 650.40 | $ 316.20 [SECONDARY S 325.20 [PRIMARY
QUOTING DR 14 -
90 PVC PIPE 659.60.C909-12X20 -- C909 CL150 C10D 12 X 20FT ULTRA BLUE JM EAGLE 10 FT S 224901 $ 447.00 |SECONDARY S 449.80 |PRIMARY
91 RUBBER COUPLING [659.06.02-44SG -- 4CLAY X 4PVC/CI W/SHEAR GUARD INDIANA SEAL 40 each | $ 436.00 | $ 10.90 S 13.67 S 12.37
92 RUBBER COUPLING [659.06.02-665G -- 6CLAY X 6PVC/CI W/SHEAR GUARD INDIANA SEAL 260 each | $ 4,771.00 | $ 18.35 S 21.17 S 19.15
93 RUBBER COUPLING [659.06.02-88SG -- 8CLAY X 8PVC/CI W/SHEAR GUARD INDIANA SEAL 24 each | $ 609.84 | $ 26.19 S 29.51 S 25.41
WAREHOUSE NEEDS
DIFFERENT QUALITY
94 RUBBER COUPLING |659.06.02-E64SG -- OFFSET 6CLAY X 4PVC/Cl W/SHEAR GUARD FERNCO 40 each | § 2,065.60 | $ 17.67 |ITEM S 57.75 S 51.64
95 RUBBER CPLR 659.06.56-44SG -- 4PVC/CI X 4PVC/Cl W/ SHEAR GUARD INDIANA SEAL 75 each | $ 774.00 ) S 10.32 S 12.93 S 11.56
96 RUBBER CPLR 659.06.06-665G -- 6CONCRETE X 6PVC/Cl W/ SHEAR GUARD INDIANA SEAL 12 each | $ 208.68 | S 17.39 S 21.17 S 19.28
97 RUBBER CPLR 659.06.56-665G -- 6PVC/Cl X 6PVC/ClI W/ SHEAR GUARD INDIANA SEAL 30 each | $ 506.40 | S 16.88 S 21.17 S 18.71
98 RUBBER CPLR 659.06.06-88SG -- 8CONCRETE X 8PVC/Cl W/ SHEAR GUARD INDIANA SEAL 10 each | $ 23540 | S 23.54 S 29.51 S 25.78
99 RUBBER CPLR 659.06.56-885G -- 8PVC/Cl X 8PVC/ClI W/ SHEAR GUARD FERNCO 15 each | $ 322.95) S 21.53 S 27.00 S 24.14
100 RUBBER CPLR 659.06.02-1010SG -- 10CLAY X 10PVC/CI W/ SHEAR GUARD INDIANA SEAL 6 each | $ 190.80 | $ 31.80 S 39.88 S 34.84
101 PVC BEND 659.17.71704 -- 22.5D 4B~B IPS DWV CL160 PLASTIC TRENDS 6 each | $ 19194 S 31.99 S 37.99 S 35.75
102 PVC BEND 659.17.T1714 - 22.5D 4 B~S IPS DWV CL160 PLASTIC TRENDS 6 each | $ 196.74 | S 32.79 S 38.94 S 36.22
103 PVC BEND 659.17.7504 -- 45D 4 B~B IPS DWV CL160 PLASTIC TRENDS 6 each | $ 187.26 | $ 31.21 S 37.06 S 34.08
104 PVC BEND 659.17.T404 -- 45D 4 B~S IPS DWV CL160 PLASTIC TRENDS 6 each | $ 190.98 | $ 31.83 S 37.80 S 33.98
105 PVC BEND 659.17.122-040 -- 45D 4 B~B IPS CL200 SDR21 HARCO 6 each | $ 198.78 | $ 33.13 S 39.33 S 36.59
106 PVC BEND 659.17.124-040 -- 22D 4 B~B IPS CL200 SDR21 HARCO 6 each | $ 521.76 | S 86.96 S 103.26 S 97.19
107 PVC BEND 659.17.G1704 -- 22.5D 4BELL X 4BELL SDR-35 PLASTIC TRENDS 24 each | $ 11856 | $ 4.94 S 5.88 S 5.53
108 PVC BEND 659.17.G1706 -- 22.5D 6BELL X 6BELL SDR-35 PLASTIC TRENDS 2 each | $§ 19.48] S 9.74 S 10.98 S 10.89
109 PVC BEND 659.17.G1708 - 22.5D 8BELL X 8BELL SDR-35 PLASTIC TRENDS 1 each | $ 280913 28.09 $ 33.70 S 30.99
110 PVC BEND 659.17.G1714 -- 22.5D 4BELL X 4SPIGOT SDR-35 PLASTIC TRENDS 90 each | $ 423.90) S 4.71 S 5.59 S 5.08
111 PVC BEND 659.17.G1716 -- 22.5D 6BELL X 6SPIGOT SDR-35 PLASTIC TRENDS 1 each | $ 9.24)$ 9.24 $ 10.98 $ 9.98
112 PVC BEND 659.17.G404 - 45D 4BELL X 4SPIGOT SDR-35 PLASTIC TRENDS 50 each | $ 22250 | S 4.45 S 5.29 S 4.81
113 PVC BEND 659.17.G504 - 45D 4BELL X 4BELL SDR-35 PLASTIC TRENDS 64 each | $ 316.80 ] S 4.95 $ 5.88 S 5.34
114 PVC BEND 659.17.G508 -- 45D 8BELL X 8BELL SDR-35 PLASTIC TRENDS 1 each | $ 2813 S 28.13 S 33.40 S 30.71
115 RUBBER CAP 659.27.EC-4 -- FAST CAP 4ID X 1.25 PVC/CI SDR35 PIPE CONX 100 each | $ 200.00 | $ 2.00 S 2.39 S 3.05
116 PVC COUPLING 659.33.G6210 -- 10 BELL~BELL SDR35 W/O STOP PLASTIC TRENDS 2 each [ $ 99.76 | $ 49.88 $ 59.24 S 54.47
117 PVC COUPLING 659.33.G6212 -- 12 BELL~BELL SDR35 W/O STOP PLASTIC TRENDS 2 each | $ 144.96 | $ 72.48 S 86.08 S 76.51
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B20 & FERGUSON
Fortiline Associates HD Supply WATERWORKS
EST.
ANNUAL
ITEM# |LOT SHORT DESCRIPTION MANUF. USAGE  |Unit | EXT. TOTAL ALL | Price Notes Price Notes Price Notes Price Notes
118 PVC COUPLING 659.33.G624 -- 4 BELL~BELL SDR35 W/O STOP PLASTIC TRENDS 15 each | $ 91.80 | $ 6.12 $ 7.26 $ 6.46
119 PVC COUPLING 659.33.G626 -- 6 BELL~BELL SDR35 W/O STOP PLASTIC TRENDS 150 each | $ 1,833.00 | $ 12.22 $ 14.51 $ 12.90
120 PVC COUPLING 659.33.G628 -- 8 BELL~BELL SDR35 W/O STOP PLASTIC TRENDS 25 each | $ 518.75 | $ 20.75 $ 24.64 $ 21.90
121 PVC COUPLING 659.33.7624 -- 4 BELL~BELL IPS DWV CL160 PLASTIC TRENDS 4 each | $ 44241 % 11.06 S 13.95 S 12.40
122 PVC COUPLING 659.33.7626 -- 8 BELL~BELL IPS DWV CL160 PLASTIC TRENDS 4 each | $ 172.72 ) $ 43.18 $ 51.28 $ 45.58
123 PVC COUPLING 659.33.109-040 -- 4 BELL~BELL IPS CL200 SDR21 HARCO 4 each | $ 101.48 | $ 25.37 $ 30.13 $ 26.78
124 PVC COUPLING 659.33.109-080 -- 8 BELL~BELL IPS CL200 SDR21 HARCO 4 each | $ 367.24] $ 91.81 $ 109.03 $ 96.91
125 PVC PLUG 659.54.71164 -- 4 SPIGOT IPS DWV CL160 PLASTIC TRENDS 2 each [ $ 221213 11.06 $ 13.14 $ 11.68
126 PVC PLUG 659.54.40040 - 4-W/WING NUT CHERNE 35 each | $ 180.25 | $ 5.15 $ 6.14
127 PVC PLUG 659.54.40060 - 6-W/WING NUT CHERNE 41 each | $ 559.24 | $ 13.64 $ 16.68
128 PVC PLUG 659.54.40080 -- 8-W/WING NUT CHERNE 2 each | $ 51.82]$ 25.91 $ 31.64
129 PVC PLUG 659.54.P1154 - 4MIP-W/MALE SQU DRIVE PLASTIC TRENDS 5 each | $ 770} $ 2.00 $ 1.71 $ 1.54
130 PVC PLUG 659.54.TEMP4 -- 4 TEMP PLUG POLYETHYLENE PLASTIC TRENDS 20 each | $ 44401 $ 2.22 $ 2.50 $ 2.25
131 PVC PLUG 659.54.TEMP6 -- 6 TEMP PLUG POLYETHYLENE PLASTIC TRENDS 10 each | $ 33.00] $ 3.30 $ 3.71 $ 3.34
132 PVC TEE 659.85.T1658-4 -- SANITARY 8 X 4 IPS CL160 SDR26 HARCO 4 each | $ 443.00 | $  110.75 $ 131.50 $ 116.89
133 PVC TEE 659.85.112-840 - STRAIGHT 8 X 4 IPS CL200 SDR21 HARCO 4 each | $ 689.96 | $  172.49 $ 204.84 $ 178.12
134 PVC TEE 659.85.G108-4 -- STRAIGHT 8 X 4 BELL SDR35 PLASTIC TRENDS 8 each | $ 20552 | $ 25.69 $ 30.51 $ 27.43
135 PVC TEE 659.85.G157 -- SANITARY 6 X 6 BELL SDR35 PLASTIC TRENDS 1 each | $ 24.05 ) $ 24.05 $ 28.56 $ 25.67
136 PVC TEE 659.85.G157-4 -- SANITARY 6 X 4 BELL SDR35 PLASTIC TRENDS 150 each | $ 3,093.00 | $ 20.62 $ 24.49 $ 22.01
137 PVC TEE 659.85.G158-4 - SANITARY 8 X 4 BELL SDR35 PLASTIC TRENDS 8 each | $ 218.00 | $ 27.25 $ 3236 $ 29.09
138 PVC WYE 659.94.G306 - 6 X 6 BELL SDR35 PLASTIC TRENDS 1 each | $ 19.60 | $ 19.60 $ 23.28 $ 20.46
139 PVC WYE 659.94.G306-4 - 6 X 4 BELL SDR35 PLASTIC TRENDS 5 each | $ 86.60 | $ 17.32 $ 20.56 $ 18.08
140 PVC WYE 659.94.G308-4 -- 8 X 4 BELL SDR35 PLASTIC TRENDS 3 each | $ 77491 $ 25.83 $ 30.68 $ 26.67
141 PVC TEE 659.85.71108-4 -- 8 BELL X 4 BELL IPS DWV CL160 HARCO 2 each | $ 140.16 | $ 70.08 $ 83.23 S 73.16
142 PVC GLAND 659.44.MLC04 -- MEGA-LUG KIT 4 W/MJ GSKT & T-BOLTS SIGMA 10 each | $ 280.00 | $ 28.00 [STAR - PRIMARY $ 31.69 [SECONDARY
143 PVC GLAND 659.44.MLCO6 -- MEGA-LUG KIT 6 W/MJ GSKT & T-BOLTS SIGMA 40 each | $ 1,400.00 | $ 35.00 [PRIMARY $ 39.66 [SECONDARY
144 PVC GLAND 659.44.MLCO8 -- MEGA-LUG KIT 8 W/MJ GSKT & T-BOLTS SIGMA 50 each | $ 2,350.00 | $ 47.00 |PRIMARY $ 53.54 [SECONDARY
145 PVC 658.60.2INSERT —- 255 CTS INSERT FORD 400 each | $ 704.00 | $ 1.76 $ 2.08
™M
MANUFACTURIN
146 PVC 659.85.WWAC -- WASTE WATER ACCESS CHAMBER 6-12 G 20 each | $ 9,600.00 | $  515.00 $ 480.00
147 TOOL 445.06.DT100 -- DRILL/TAP-1XCC REED 13 each | $ 2,145.00 | $  165.00 $ 194.69
148 TOOL 445.06.TMTC - DRILL/TAP LUBE REED 13 each | $ 247.00 | $ 19.00 $ 21.96
149 PTAPE 832.62.PIPETAPEL -- PVC PIPE WRAP 2X 100FT X 10MIL NONE SPECIFIED 48 each | $ 216.00 | $ 4.50 $ 5.67
150 TOOL 890.45.KEYLG - 45D METER BOX KEY / CORP WRENCH B&K 3 each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BASS AND HAYS KEY
151 TOOL 890.45.KEYSM -- METER BOX KEY BRASS W/TEE HANDLE MUELLER 48 each [ $ 480.00 | $ 10.00 |52 S 12.41 $ 10.59
152 TOOL 890.45.MKDT -- METER BOX KEY W/HAMMER HEAD REED 20 each [ $ 184.20 | $ 10.00 |REED MKDT $ 9.21
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