
BID TAB - 2017 UTILITY PARTS
Bid # 2017-07 - Utility Parts Re-Bid

NOTES:

SOME ITEMS AWARDED BY CATEGORY/GROUPING FOR EFFICIENCY

ITEM # 3 - LOW BID HAS 2 1/8" AMR HOLE, TOO LARGE FOR CITY'S NEEDS

ITEMS #4 AND #8 GO TOGETHER

ITEMS #5 AND #9 GO TOGETHER

ITEMS # 18 - 19 - AQUA METRIC PRICES APPEAR TO BE REVERSED

ITEM # 92 - LOW BID IS HALF OF PURCHASE PRICE SINCE 2014 - SEEMS INCORRECT

ITEM #97, 99 - LOW BID IS INCONSISTENT WITH PURCHASE HISTORY - SEEMS INCORRECT

ITEM # 101 - HD SUPPLY HAS FASTER LEAD TIME

ITEMS # 115 - 155 - BRAND FROM FERGUSON UNCLEAR (BRAND DOES NOT MATCH ITEM #S)

ITEM #117 - CHARLOTTE PART IS GLUE FIT, CITY NEEDS GASKET FIT

ITEM # 158 - 163 - SOME LOW BID MODEL NUMBERS INCONSISTENT WITH BRAND; CATEGORY GIVEN TO NEXT LOW BIDDER FOR EFFICIENCY

PRIMARY 51,402.24$      PRIMARY 133,960.52$                PRIMARY 50,781.14$          PRIMARY 125,158.01$                 PRIMARY  $          275,507.60 PRIMARY  $          13,045.90 

SECONDARY 4,680.00$                    SECONDARY 180.85$               SECONDARY 142,230.13$                 SECONDARY  $          160,069.80 SECONDARY  $        196,414.94 

ATLAS AQUA METRIC B2O FERGUSON  Fortiline  HD SUPPLY 

CITY SHORT UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED  UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED  UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED

ITEM PART NUMBER DESCRIPTION PRICE BRAND MODEL # PRICE BRAND MODEL # PRICE BRAND MODEL # PRICE BRAND MODEL #  PRICE BRAND MODEL #  PRICE BRAND MODEL #

GRAND TOTAL
COPPER TUBING TOTAL

1. 658.88.SK075-100 SOFT-K: 3/4" X 100FT ROLL -$                      0 0 3.06$               MUELLER  KSOFTF100  $            3.00  ksg  type k  $             3.00  WIELAND 0

2. 658.88.SK100-100 SOFT-K:  1" X 100FT ROLL -$                      0 0 3.98$               MUELLER  C9ETBK100  $            4.00  ksg  type k  $             4.00  WIELAND 0

WATER METER BOXES TOTAL

3. 890.40.18PGMB

POLY BASE 18" X 15" DI RING & 

LID W/ 3/4" AMR HOLE -$                      0 0 128.00$  B2O PGMB 18X15 DI 71.00$             WHITE RHINO 

 WRMC- 18X15 CI LID

CITY COMMENT - 

AMR HOLE IS 2 1/8", 

TOO BIG FOR NEEDS  $        130.00  B2O  18PGMB  NO-BID 

4. 890.40.DFW1324B POLY BASE 13" X 24" X 18" DEEP -$                      0 0 87.98$             DFW  DFW-1324C-18-BODY  $          88.00 

 DFW 

PLASTICS 

 DFW-1324C-18-

BODY

CITY COMMENT - 

ITEM #4 GOES 

WITH ITEM #8  $           95.00  DFW 

DFW1324C-18-

BODY FULL PALLETS ONLY. 8/PALLET

5. 890.40.DFW1730B POLY BASE 17" X 30" X 18" DEEP -$                      0 0 118.35$           DFW  DFW-1730C-18-BODY  $        115.00 

 DFW 

PLASTICS 

 DFW-1730C-18-

BODY

CITY COMMENT - 

ITEM #5 GOES 

WITH ITEM #9  $         124.00  DFW 

DFW1730C-18-

BODY FULL PALLETS ONLY 4/PALLET

6. 890.45.DFW1324C

POLY 13" X 24" X 18"DEEP W/1-

AMR LID -$                      0 0 145.83$           DFW  DFW-1324C-18-1BAF  $        145.00 

 DFW 

PLASTICS 

 DFW-1324C-18-

1BAF  $         154.00  DFW 

DFW1324C-18-

1BAF FULL PALLETS ONLY 8/PALLET

7. 890.40.DFW1730C

POLY 17" X 30" X 18"DEEP W/2 

AMR LID -$                      0 0 194.50$           DFW 

 DFW-1730C-18-

1BAF2  $        194.00 

 DFW 

PLASTICS 

 DFW-1730C-18-

1BAF2  $         210.00  DFW 

DFW1730C-18-

1BAF2 FULL PALLETS ONLY 4/PALLET

8. 890.40.BH1324DILID

DI LID 13X24 W/ PLAIN LID AND 

3/4" AMR HOLE -$                      0 0 80.62$             BASS-HAYS  BPMSBC1324LID3  $          78.00  BASS-HAYS 

 PMSBC1324LID1  

3/4 HOLE  $           84.30  B&H 

PMSBC1324LID1 

WITH 3/4 HOLD

9. 890.40.DFW1730L

DI LID 17X30 W/ 2-ARM HOLES 

W/ 3/4" AMR HOLE -$                      0 0 86.08$             DFW  D-32131759  $        125.00 

 DFW 

PLASTICS  $     32,131,759.00  $         135.00  DFW EJ32131769

10. 890.40.WHITECAN

18X18 PLASTIC BOX W/ DI LID 

AND RING W/ 3/4" AMR HOLE -$                      0 0 110.48$           ACCU-CAST  A-846212  $        110.00  ACCU-CAST  $          846,212.00  $         117.00  ACCUCAST 846212

11. 890.40.P34PD18

18X18 PLASTIC BOX W/ DI LID 

AND RING AND 3/4" AMR HOLE -$                      0 0 116.03$           BASS-HAYS  B-P4PD18  $        115.00  BASS & HAYS  P34PD18  $         117.00  B&H P34PD18

WATER METERS TOTAL

12. 890.44.1BADGER

1" BRNZ BTM W/HRE 8 WHL-G & 

ITRON 5' ILC 146.96$          BADGER

1" M-55-LL 

W/HRE (8 DIAL 

ENCODER W 

ITRON 5' ILC) -$                      0 0  NO-BID  $                -    NO-BID 

13. 890.44.75BADGER

3/4" BRNZ BTM W/HRE 8 WHL-G 

& ITRON 5' ILC 94.50$            BADGER

3/4" M-25-LL 

W/HRE (8 DIAL 

ENCODER W 

ITRON 5' ILC) -$                      0 0  NO-BID  $                -    NO-BID 

14. 890.44.150C2 1.5" OMNI C2 USG 8 WHEEL 1,137.87$             Sensus OMNI C2 with Itron ILC  NO-BID  $                -    NO-BID 

15. 890.44.150T2

1.5" OMNI T2 USG 8 WHEEL 

W/25' ITRON ILC 789.52$                Sensus OMNI T2 with Itron ILC  NO-BID  $                -    NO-BID 

16. 890.44.200C2 2" OMNI C2 USG 8 WHEEL 1,307.65$             Sensus OMNI C2 with Itron ILC  NO-BID  $                -    NO-BID 

17. 890.44.200T2 2" OMNI T2 USG 8 WHEEL 930.11$                Sensus OMNI T2 with Itron ILC  NO-BID  $                -    NO-BID 
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ATLAS AQUA METRIC B2O FERGUSON  Fortiline  HD SUPPLY 

CITY SHORT UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED  UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED  UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED

ITEM PART NUMBER DESCRIPTION PRICE BRAND MODEL # PRICE BRAND MODEL # PRICE BRAND MODEL # PRICE BRAND MODEL #  PRICE BRAND MODEL #  PRICE BRAND MODEL #

18. 890.45.MF150 FLANGE ONLY 1-1/2"

 $28.00

WILL ADJUST TO 

$24.00 FOR 

CONTRACT 

Midland 

Manufacturing

FLG1.5C

CITY COMMENT - 

PRICES APPEAR TO 

BE REVERSED 24.17$    MIDCO 1911  NO-BID  $                -    $           27.00  WHITE RHINO 0

19. 890.45.MF200 FLANGE ONLY 2"

 $24.00

WILL ADJUST TO 

$28.00 FOR 

CONTRACT 

Midland 

Manufacturing

FLG2C

CITY COMMENT - 

PRICES ON FLANGES 

APPEAR TO BE 

REVERSED 26.17$    MIDCO 1921  NO-BID  $                -    $           29.00  WHITE RHINO 0

DUCTILE IRON PIPE, FITTINGS, AND VALVES TOTAL

20. 659.17.45D0606 (1/8) 6"MJ X 6"MJ C153 -$                      0 0 34.48$             SIGMA  S-DMB645  $          34.00  SIGMA  DMB 645  $           37.30  STAR 0

21. 659.27.TCAP04 PIPE CAP 4"MJ C153 -$                      0 0 9.53$               SIGMA  S-DMK4  $            9.50  SIGMA  DMK4  $           10.20  STAR 0

22. 659.27.TCAP04X02 PIPE CAP 4"MJ W/2" IP TAP C153 -$                      0 0 19.99$             SIGMA  S-DTK4  $          20.00  SIGMA  DTK4  $           21.70  STAR 0

23. 659.27.TCAP06 PIPE CAP 6"MJ C153 -$                      0 0 16.88$             SIGMA  S-DMK6  $          16.50  SIGMA  DMK6  $           18.20  STAR 0

24. 659.27.TCAP08 PIPE CAP 8"MJ C153 -$                      0 0 28.08$             SIGMA  S-DMK8  $          28.00  SIGMA  DMK8  $           30.40  STAR 0

25. 659.33.0606ANC13L

ANCHOR 6"PE X 6"ANC X 13"L 

C153 -$                      0 0 70.00$             SIGMA  S-SSA612  $          70.00  SIGMA  SSA612  $           76.00  STAR 0

26. 659.33.0808ANC12L

ANCHOR 8"PE X 8"ANC X 13"L 

C153 -$                      0 0 90.00$             SIGMA  S-SSA812  $          90.00  SIGMA  SSA813  $           97.40  STAR 0

27. 659.54.TPLG04 PIPE PLUG 4"MJ C153 -$                      0 0 11.60$             SIGMA  S-DMP4  $          11.50  SIGMA  DMP4  $           12.50  STAR 0

28. 659.54.TPLG06 PIPE PLUG  6"MJ C153 -$                      0 0 21.98$             SIGMA  S-DMP6  $          22.00  SIGMA  DMP6  $           24.30  STAR 0

29. 659.54.TPLG08 PIPE PLUG  8"MJ C153 -$                      0 0 33.00$             SIGMA  S-DMP8  $          33.00  SIGMA  DMP8  $           36.50  STAR 0

30. 659.54.TPLG12 PIPE PLUG 12"MJ C153 -$                      0 0 57.98$             SIGMA  SDMP12  $          57.00  SIGMA  DMP12  $           63.20  STAR 0

31. 659.73.CI0404PE 4"MJ X 4"PE C153 W/O ACC -$                      0 0 210.00$           SIGMA  S-DCL4  $        210.00  SIGMA  DCL4  $         228.00  STAR 0

32. 659.73.CI0606PE 6"MJ X 6"PE C153 W/O ACC -$                      0 0 178.00$           SIGMA  S-DCL6  $        175.00  SIGMA  DCL6  $         192.00  STAR 0

33. 659.73.CI0808PE 8"MJ X 8"PE C153 W/O ACC -$                      0 0 235.00$           SIGMA  S-DCL8  $        235.00  SIGMA  DCL8  $         254.00  STAR 0

34. 659.73.SL0412 4"MJ X 12"L C153 -$                      0 0 22.80$             SIGMA  S-DML4  $          22.50  SIGMA  DML4  $           24.70  STAR 0

35. 659.73.SL0612 6"MJ X 12"L C153 -$                      0 0 38.40$             SIGMA  S-DML6  $          38.00  SIGMA  DML6  $           41.50  STAR 0

36. 659.73.SL0812 8"MJ X 12"L C153 -$                      0 0 61.98$             SIGMA  S-DML8  $          62.00  SIGMA  DML8  $           68.00  STAR 0

37. 659.73.SL1012 10"MJ X 12"L C153 -$                      0 0 74.00$             SIGMA  S-DML10  $          74.00  SIGMA  DML10  $           81.00  STAR 0

38. 670.75.02T02T 2"FIP X 2"FIP -$                      0 0  NO-BID  $        205.00  Kennedy 

 C509 8000 

SERIES  $         223.00  MUELLER A2361-8

39. 670.75.0404

4"MJ X 4"MJ - W/O 

ACCESSORIES -$                      0 0 361.18$           MUELLER  MA23602304  $        320.00  Kennedy 

 C509 8000 

SERIES  $         365.00  MUELLER A2361-23

40. 670.75.0606

6"MJ X 6"MJ - W/O 

ACCESSORIES -$                      0 0 455.82$           MUELLER  MA23602306  $        440.00  Kennedy 

 C509 8000 

SERIES  $         465.00  MUELLER A2361-23

41. 670.75.0808

8"MJ X 8"MJ - WO 

/ACCESSORIES -$                      0 0 711.00$           MUELLER  MA2362308  $        680.00  Kennedy 

 C509 8000 

SERIES  $         741.00  MUELLER A2361-23

42. 670.75.1010

10"MJ X 10"MJ - W/O 

ACCESSORIES -$                      0 0 1,108.60$        MUELLER  MA2362310  $    1,000.00  Kennedy 

 C509 8000 

SERIES  $      1,156.00  MUELLER A2361-23

43. 670.75.1212

12"MJ X 12"MJ - W/O 

ACCESSORIES -$                      0 0 1,400.00$        MUELLER  MA2362312  $    1,300.00  Kennedy 

 C509 8000 

SERIES  $      1,463.00  MUELLER A2361-23

44. 210.72.02X24

MANHOLE RISER/GUIDE RING 

2"X24 -$                      0 0 17.87$             BASS-HAYS  FGMH GRADE R-2  $          15.00 

 AMERICAN 

MAATCO  2GR24  $           18.00  $                           -   0

45. 210.72.03X24

MANHOLE RISER/GUIDE RING 

3"X24 -$                      0 0 22.50$             BASS-HAYS  FGMH GRADER-3  $          19.00 

 AMERICAN 

MAATCO  3GR24  $           22.00  $                           -   0

46. 659.73.SDL4X1CC

SADDLE 4" X 1" CC W/2-SS 

BANDS DI/C900 -$                      0 0 68.17$    JCM 404-0480-09 59.19$             ROMAC  202NS 4X1CC  $          38.00  ROMAC IND  202NS 4X1CC  $           38.80  SMITH BLAIR 317 317

47. 659.73.SDL4X2IP

SADDLE 4" X 2" IP W/2-SS 

BANDS DI/C900 -$                      0 0 82.17$    JCM 404-0480-14 64.44$             ROMAC  202NS 4X2IP  $          45.00  ROMAC IND  202NS 4X2IP  $           46.80  SMITH BLAIR 317 317

48. 659.73.SDL6X1CC

SADDLE 6" X1"CC W/2-SS 

BANDS DI/C900 -$                      0 0 78.17$    JCM 404-0690-09 68.00$             ROMAC  202NS 6X1CC  $          43.00  ROMAC IND  202NS 6X1CC  $           44.70  SMITH BLAIR 317 317

49. 659.73.SDL6X2IP

SADDLE 6" X 2" IP W/2-SS 

BANDS DI/C900 -$                      0 0 88.17$    JCM 404-0690-14 73.86$             ROMAC  202NS 6X2IP  $          48.00  ROMAC IND  202NS 6X2IP  $           53.40  SMITH BLAIR 317 317

50. 659.73.SDL8X1CC

SADDLE 8" X1"CC W/2-SS 

BANDS DI/C900 -$                      0 0 99.17$    JCM 404-0905-07 79.09$             ROMAC  202NS 08X1CC  $          49.00  ROMAC IND  202NS 08X1CC  $           52.70  SMITH BLAIR 317 317

51. 659.73.SDL8X2IP

SADDLE 8" X 2" IP W/2-SS 

BANDS DI/C900 -$                      0 0 110.17$  JCM 404-0905-14 84.29$             ROMAC  202NS 8X2IP  $          56.00  ROMAC IND  202NS 8X2IP  $           62.20  SMITH BLAIR 317 317

52. 890.00.7262 STORMWATER CURB OPENING -$                      0 0 85.50$             BASS-HAYS 7262  $          85.00  BASS-HAYS  $              7,262.00  $           95.00  B&H 7262

53. 890.30.75C400S COVER SANITARY 24" #400 B&H -$                      0 0 171.90$           BASS-HAYS  75C400S  $        170.00  BASS & HAYS  40024C10LID  $         185.00  B&H 40024C10LID

54. 890.30.75R24400 RING 24" #400-24A B&H -$                      0 0 171.90$           BASS-HAYS  75R24400  $        170.00  BASS & HAYS  40024 RING-D  $         185.00  B&H 40024 RING-D

55. 890.30.BH400 COVER STORM 24" #400 B&H -$                      0 0 171.45$           BASS-HAYS  B-400  $        170.00  BASS & HAYS  40024C20LID  $         185.00  B&H 40024C20LID

56. 890.30.FBRGLS5

FIBERGLASS MANHOLE 48"X5' 

STD WALL -$                      0 0 730.00$           LF MFG  M480506  $        800.00  LF MFG  M480506  $         835.00  LF MFG 0

57. 890.40.340-1

STD.2-PIECE-7-1/4" W/TOP 

FLANGE -$                      0 0 46.30$             BASS-HAYS  B340-1  $          40.00  ACCUCAST  340-1  $           52.00  B&H 340-1

58. 890.30.INSERT5 INFLOW PROTECTOR 5" -$                      0 0 42.17$    SW SERV DC-456 47.80$             BASS-HAYS  B5052  $          15.00 

 CONN 

SUPPLY  REF PO 1624403  $           27.00  B&H INFLOW STOP 3

59. 659.44.MLDC04

MEGA-LUG KIT 4" DI & C900 W/ 

GSKT & T-BOLTS -$                      0 0 31.00$             TYLER PIPE  606600  $          31.00 

 TYLER PIPE 

DOMESTIC   670610  603100  $           27.40  TYLER 602200

60. 659.44.MLDC06

MEGA-LUG KIT 6" DI & C900 W/ 

GSKT & T-BOLTS -$                      0 0 38.00$             TYLER PIPE  602205  $          38.00 

 TYLER PIPE 

DOMESTIC   670610  603105  $           34.30  TYLER 602205
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ATLAS AQUA METRIC B2O FERGUSON  Fortiline  HD SUPPLY 

CITY SHORT UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED  UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED  UNIT PROPOSED PROPOSED

ITEM PART NUMBER DESCRIPTION PRICE BRAND MODEL # PRICE BRAND MODEL # PRICE BRAND MODEL # PRICE BRAND MODEL #  PRICE BRAND MODEL #  PRICE BRAND MODEL #

61. 659.44.MLDC08

MEGA-LUG KIT 8" DI & C900 W/ 

GSKT & T-BOLTS -$                      0 0 52.25$             TYLER PIPE  602210  $          52.00 

 TYLER PIPE 

DOMESTIC   670610  603110  $           46.40  TYLER 602210

62. 659.44.MLDC10

MEGA-LUG KIT 10" DI & C900 W/ 

GSKT & T-BOLTS -$                      0 0 90.00$             TYLER PIPE  602215  $          90.00 

 TYLER PIPE 

DOMESTIC   670610  603115  $           80.70  TYLER 602215

63. 659.44.MLDC12

MEGA-LUG KIT 12" DI & C900 W/ 

GSKT & T-BOLTS -$                      0 0 93.25$             SIGMA 602220  $          93.00 

 TYLER PIPE 

DOMESTIC   670610  603120  $           84.70  TYLER 602220

64. 659.44.PAK04

RETAINER PAK 4"MJ GASKET / 

BOLTS ONLY -$                      0 0 8.62$               SIGMA  MGP4  $            6.50  SIGMA  MGP4  $             7.00  STAR 0

65. 659.44.PAK06

RETAINER PAK 6"MJ GASKET / 

BOLTS ONLY -$                      0 0 10.79$             SIGMA  MGP6  $            8.00  SIGMA  MGP6  $             8.60  STAR 0

66. 659.44.PAK08

RETAINER PAK 8"MJ GASKET / 

BOLTS ONLY -$                      0 0 11.49$             SIGMA  MGP8  $            9.00  SIGMA  MGP8  $             9.40  STAR 0

67. 659.44.PAK10

RETAINER PAK 10"MJ GASKET / 

BOLTS ONLY -$                      0 0 15.42$             SIGMA  MGP10  $          12.00  SIGMA  MGP10  $           12.60  STAR 0

68. 659.44.PAK12

RETAINER PAK 12"MJ GASKET / 

BOLTS ONLY -$                      0 0 16.65$             SIGMA  MGP12  $          13.00  SIGMA  MGP12  $           13.40  STAR 0

FIRE HYDRANT TOTAL

69. 340.60.BAWKIT CLOW BREAK-AWAY KIT -$                      0 0 98.60$             HYD REPAIR  HRPI653  $        100.00  HRPI  HRPI653  $         113.00  HRPI-653 0

70. 340.60.BAWKIT-K KENNEDY BREAK-AWAY KIT -$                      0 0 93.91$             HYD REPAIR  HRPI 5-8149  $        100.00  HRPI  HRPI 5-8149  $         108.00  HRPI-5-8149 0

71. 340.60.EXT06-K

EXTENSION  6" KENNEDY 81A 

FH -$                      0 0 187.82$           HYD REPAIR 

 HRPI, FITS 5 1/4 

KENNEDY 81A FH  $        220.00  HRPI 

 HRPI, FITS 5 1/4 

KENNEDY 81A FH  $         261.00  HRPI 0

72. 340.60.EXT06 EXTENSION  6" CLOW FH -$                      0 0 206.60$           HYD REPAIR 

 EXTENSION  6" 

CLOW FH  $        220.00  $         287.00  HRPI 0

73. 340.60.EXT12-K

EXTENSION  12" KENNEDY 81A 

FH -$                      0 0 214.43$           HYD REPAIR 

 HRPI, FITS 5 1/4 

KENNEDY 81A FH  $        240.00  HRPI 

 HRPI, FITS 5 1/4 

KENNEDY 81A FH  $         297.00  HRPI 0

74. 340.60.EXT12 EXTENSION 12" CLOW FH -$                      0 0 244.17$           HYD REPAIR 

 EXTENSION 12" 

CLOW FH  $        240.00  HRPI  $         339.00  HRPI 0

75. 340.60.EXT24 EXTENSION 24" CLOW FH -$                      0 0 313.04$           HYD REPAIR 

 EXTENSION 24" 

CLOW FH  $        350.00  HRPI  $         435.00  HRPI 0

76. 340.60.EXTKIT

EXTENSION GASKET KIT - 

W/BOLTS -$                      0 0 115.04$           HYD REPAIR  HRPI-475  $        150.00 

 HYD REPAIR 

PTS   HRPI-475  $         169.00  HRPI 0

77. 340.60.HYD36

36" BURY WITH 5-1/4"  DAL 

SPEC STMR NZZL -$                      0 0  NO-BID  $    1,500.00  Kennedy  K81  $      1,593.00  MUELLER A423

78. 340.60.HYD48

48" BURY WITH 5-1/4"  DAL 

SPEC STMR NZZL -$                      0 0  NO-BID  $    1,600.00  Kennedy  K81  $      1,669.00  MUELLER A423

79. 340.60.HYD60

60" BURY WITH 5-1/4"  DAL 

SPEC STMR NZZL -$                      0 0  NO-BID  $    1,700.00  Kennedy  K81  $      1,745.00  MUELLER A423

80. 340.60.NIS-BAG

"NOT IN SERVICE" BAG-POUCH 

OF 8 -$                      0 0 36.17$    AFSI NIS BAG 31.75$             POLLARD  P69250  $          40.00  POLLARD  P69250  NO-BID 

PIPE REPAIR CLAMPS TOTAL

81. 670.52.SB02X15

REPAIR CLAMP 2"(2.35-2.63) X 

15". -$                      0 0 152.17$  JCM 101-0238-15 102.25$           SMITH-BLAIR  S23800048012109  $          60.00  FORD  F1-263X15  $           75.80  SMITH BLAIR 226

82. 670.52.SB04X12.5.1CC

REPAIR CLAMP 4"(4.74-5.14) X 

12-1/2" W/1"CC -$                      0 0 228.17$  JCM 103-0474-12-07 140.50$           SMITH-BLAIR  S23800048012109  $          78.00  FORD  F1-514X125-CC4  $         109.30  SMITH BLAIR 238

83. 670.52.SB04X20

REPAIR CLAMP 4"(4.74-5.14) X 

20". -$                      0 0 231.17$  JCM 101-0424-24 211.50$           SMITH-BLAIR  S22600048030001  $        120.00  FORD  F1-514X20  $         150.00  SMITH BLAIR 226

84. 670.52.SB04X30

REPAIR CLAMP 4"(4.74-5.14) X 

30". -$                      0 0 404.17$  JCM 101-0474-30 239.60$           SMITH-BLAIR  S22600096030001  $        155.00  FORD  F1-514X30  $         226.00  SMITH BLAIR 226

85. 670.52.SB06X12.5.1CC

REPAIR CLAMP 6"(6.84-7.24) X 

12-1/2" W/ 1"CC -$                      0 0 302.17$  JCM 103-0685-12-07 130.45$           SMITH-BLAIR  S2380006901209  $          90.00  FORD  F1-724X124-CC4  $         124.00  SMITH BLAIR 238

86. 670.52.SB06X20

REPAIR CLAMP 6"(6.84-7.24) X 

20". -$                      0 0 386.17$  JCM 101-0685-24 185.00$           SMITH-BLAIR  S22600069020001  $        120.00  FORD  F1-725X20  $         173.00  SMITH BLAIR 226

87. 670.52.SB06X30

REPAIR CLAMP 6"(6.84-7.24) X 

30". -$                      0 0 464.17$  JCM 101-0685-30 255.50$           SMITH-BLAIR  S26600069030001  $        175.00  FORD  F1-725X30  $         250.00  SMITH BLAIR 226

88. 670.52.SB08X12.5.1CC

REPAIR CLAMP 8"(8.99-9.39) X 

12-1/2" W/1"CC -$                      0 0 316.17$  JCM 103-0899-12-07 116.00$           SMITH-BLAIR  S23800090512109  $        100.00  FORD  F1-939X125-CC4  $         141.00  SMITH BLAIR 238

89. 670.52.SB08X20

REPAIR CLAMP 8"(8.99-9.39) X 

20". -$                      0 0 415.17$  JCM 101-0899-24 193.65$           SMITH-BLAIR  S22600090520001  $        130.00  FORD  F1-939X20  $         198.00  SMITH BLAIR 226

90. 670.52.SB08X30

REPAIR CLAMP 8"(8.99-9.39) X 

30". -$                      0 0 519.17$  JCM 101-0899-30 281.70$           SMITH-BLAIR  S22600090530001  $        220.00  FORD  F1-939X30  $         288.00  SMITH BLAIR 226

91. 670.52.SB10X20

REPAIR CLAMP 10" (11.04-11.44) 

X 20". -$                      0 0 219.50$           SMITH-BLAIR  S22600111020001  $        155.00  FORD  F1-1144X20  $         235.00  SMITH BLAIR 226

PVC PIPE AND FITTINGS TOTAL

92. 658.60.2PEC100

SDR 9 POLYETHYLENE 2.00" X 

100FT -$                      0 0 0.76$              

 DIAMOND 

NORTH 

AMERICAN 

JET STREAM 

JM 

 SDR 9 

POLYETHYLENE 2.00" 

X 100FT  $            1.45  EGW  SDR9  $             1.50  ADS 0

93. 658.60.04X13 SDR35 4" X 14FT -$                      0 0 11.64$            

 DIAMOND 

NORTH 

AMERICAN 

JET STREAM 

JM  SDR35 4" X 14FT  $            0.88  JM  SDR35  $             0.90  JM 0

94. 658.60.06X13 SDR35 6" X 14FT -$                      0 0 2.96$              

 DIAMOND 

NORTH 

AMERICAN 

JET STREAM 

JM  SDR35 6" X 14FT  $            1.92  JM  SDR35  $             2.00  JM 0
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95. 658.60.08X13 SDR35 8" X 14FT -$                      0 0 4.64$              

 DIAMOND 

NORTH 

AMERICAN 

JET STREAM 

JM  SDR35 8" X 14FT  $            3.44  JM  SDR35  $             3.50  JM 0

96. 658.60.10X13 SDR35 10"X14FT -$                      0 0 6.66$              

 DIAMOND 

NORTH 

AMERICAN 

JET STREAM 

JM  SDR35 10"X14FT  $            5.40  JM  SDR35  $             5.50  JM 0

97. 658.60.12X13 SDR35 12"X14FT -$                      0 0 1.02$              

 DIAMOND 

NORTH 

AMERICAN 

JET STREAM 

JM  SDR35 12"X14FT  $            7.75  JM  SDR35  $             7.90  JM 0

98. 658.60.IPS4X20 SDR26 CL160 IPS 4" X 20FT -$                      0 0 2.18$              

 DIAMOND 

NORTH 

AMERICAN 

JET STREAM 

JM 

 SDR26 CL160 IPS 4" 

X 20FT  $            1.27  JM  SDR35  $             1.30  JM 0

99. 658.60.IPS8X20 SDR26 CL160 IPS 8" X 20FT -$                      0 0 1.86$              

 DIAMOND 

NORTH 

AMERICAN 

JET STREAM 

JM 

 SDR26 CL160 IPS 8" 

X 20FT  $            4.64  JM  SDR35  $             4.80  JM 0

100. 659.60.C909-04X20

C909 DR18 CL235 C10D  4" X 

20FT -$                      0 0 3.68$              

 DIAMOND 

NORTH 

AMERICAN 

JET STREAM 

JM 

 C909 DR18 CL235 

C10D  4" X 20FT  $            2.25  JM EAGLE  0135053  $             2.20  JM 0

101. 659.60.C909-06X20

C909 DR18 CL235 C10D  6" X 

20FT -$                      0 0 6.38$              

 DIAMOND 

NORTH 

AMERICAN 

JET STREAM 

JM 

 C909 DR18 CL235 

C10D  6" X 20FT  $            4.25  JM EAGLE  0135061  $             4.30  JM 0

102. 659.60.C909-08X20

C909 DR18 CL235 C10D  8" X 

20FT -$                      0 0 6.38$              

 DIAMOND 

NORTH 

AMERICAN 

JET STREAM 

JM 

 C909 DR18 CL235 

C10D  8" X 20FT  $            7.40  JM EAGLE  0135079  $             7.50  JM 0

103. 659.60.C909-10X20

C909 DR18 CL235 C10D 10 X 

20FT -$                      0 0 9.57$              

 DIAMOND 

NORTH 

AMERICAN 

JET STREAM 

JM 

 C909 DR18 CL235 

C10D 10 X 20FT  $          11.10  JM EAGLE  0135087  $           11.20  JM 0

104. 659.60.C909-12X20

C909 DR18 CL235 C10D 12 X 

20FT -$                      0 0 13.50$            

 DIAMOND 

NORTH 

AMERICAN 

JET STREAM 

JM 

 C909 DR18 CL235 

C10D 12 X 20FT  $          15.75  JM EAGLE  0135095  $           15.90  JM 0

105. 659.06.02-44SG

4"CLAY X 4"PVC/CI W/SHEAR 

GUARD -$                      0 0 10.17$    DS DS-02-44R 11.85$             FERNCO  102-44SR  $          12.00  FERNCO  102-44SR  $           13.60  FERNCO 1002-44SR

106. 659.06.02-66SG

6"CLAY X 6"PVC/CI W/SHEAR 

GUARD -$                      0 0 16.17$    DS DS-02-665R 22.20$             FERNCO  102-66SR  $          17.80  FERNCO  102-66SR  $           21.10  FERNCO 1002-66SR

107. 659.06.02-88SG

8"CLAY X 8"PVC/CI W/SHEAR 

GUARD -$                      0 0 21.17$    DS DS-02-88ESR 40.86$             FERNCO  102-88SR  $          25.00  FERNCO  102-88SR  $           31.55  FERNCO 1002-88SR

108. 659.06.02-E64SG

OFFSET 6"CLAY X 4"PVC/CI 

W/SHEAR GUARD -$                      0 0 10.17$    DS DS-56-64ESR 48.25$             FERNCO  1002-64EBSR  $          48.00  FERNCO  1002-64EBSR  $           57.60  FERNCO 1002-64EBSR

109. 659.06.56-44SG

4"PVC/CI X 4"PVC/CI W/ SHEAR 

GUARD -$                      0 0 23.17$    DS DS-56-44SR 11.45$             FERNCO  156-44SR  $          11.40  FERNCO  156-44SR  $           12.90  FERNCO 1056-44SR

110. 659.06.06-66SG

6"CONCRETE X 6"PVC/CI W/ 

SHEAR GUARD -$                      0 0 15.17$    DS DS-02-66SR 18.25$             FERNCO  106-66SR  $          18.50  FERNCO  106-66SR  $           21.75  FERNCO 1006-66SR

111. 659.06.56-66SG

6"PVC/CI X 6"PVC/CI W/ SHEAR 

GUARD -$                      0 0 21.17$    DS DS-56-66SR 16.85$             FERNCO  156-66SR  $          18.00  FERNCO  156-66SR  $           21.10  FERNCO 1056-66SR

112. 659.06.06-88SG

8"CONCRETE X 8"PVC/CI W/ 

SHEAR GUARD -$                      0 0 21.17$    DS DS-06-88SR 24.45$             FERNCO  106-88SR  $          25.00  FERNCO  106-88SR  $           29.50  FERNCO 1006-88SR

113. 659.06.56-88SG

8"PVC/CI X 8"PVC/CI W/ SHEAR 

GUARD -$                      0 0 21.17$    DS DS-56-88SR 33.90$             FERNCO  1056-88SG  $          24.00  FERNCO  1056-88SG  $           26.90  FERNCO 1056-88SR

114. 659.06.02-1010SG

10"CLAY X 10"PVC/CI W/ SHEAR 

GUARD -$                      0 0 29.17$    DS DS-56-1010SR 33.35$             FERNCO  102-1010SF  $          34.00  FERNCO  102-1010SF  $           39.80  FERNCO 1002-1010SR
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115. 659.17.T1704

22.5D 4"B~B IPS SDR26 DWV 

CL160 -$                      0 0 26.05$             CHARLOTTE 

 T1704

CITY COMMENT - 

PROPOSED BRAND 

FOR ITEMS 115 - 157 

IS NOT CLEAR, 

SAMPLE CHARLOTTE 

ITEM HAD GLUE FIT 

INSTEAD OF GASKET 

FIT.  $          33.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  T1704  $           38.60  PLASTIC TRENDS T1704

116. 659.17.T1714

22.5D 4" B~S IPS SDR26 DWV 

CL160 -$                      0 0 28.75$             CHARLOTTE  T1714  $          34.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  T1714  $           39.60  PLASTIC TRENDS T1714

117. 659.17.T504

45D 4" B~B IPS SDR26 DWV 

CL160 -$                      0 0 18.25$             CHARLOTTE  T504  $          32.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  T504  $           37.70  PLASTIC TRENDS T504

118. 659.17.T404

45D 4" B~S IPS SDR26 DWV 

CL160 -$                      0 0 25.45$             CHARLOTTE  T404  $          33.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  T404  $           38.50  PLASTIC TRENDS T404

119. 659.17.122-040 45D 4" B~B IPS CL200 SDR21 -$                      0 0 34.35$             CHARLOTTE  122-040  $          34.00  HARCO  122-040  $           41.00  HARCO 122-040

120. 659.17.124-040 22D 4" B~B IPS CL200 SDR21 -$                      0 0 34.65$             CHARLOTTE  124-040  $          90.00  HARCO  124-040  $         130.00  HARCO 124-040

121. 659.17.G1704 22.5D 4"BELL X 4"BELL SDR-35 -$                      0 0 5.15$              

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G1704  $            6.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G1704  $             6.95  PLASTIC TRENDS G1704

122. 659.17.G1706 22.5D 6"BELL X 6"BELL SDR-35 -$                      0 0 10.00$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G1706  $          12.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G1706  $           13.70  PLASTIC TRENDS G1706

123. 659.17.G1708 22.5D 8"BELL X 8"BELL SDR-35 -$                      0 0 29.60$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G1708  $          35.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G1708  $           40.00  PLASTIC TRENDS G1708

124. 659.17.G1714

22.5D 4"BELL X 4"SPIGOT SDR-

35 -$                      0 0 4.87$              

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G1714  $            6.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G1714  $             6.60  PLASTIC TRENDS G1714

125. 659.17.G1716

22.5D 6"BELL X 6"SPIGOT SDR-

35 -$                      0 0 9.70$              

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G1716  $          11.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G1716  $           13.00  PLASTIC TRENDS G1716

126. 659.17.G404 45D 4"BELL X 4"SPIGOT SDR-35 -$                      0 0 4.65$              

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G404  $            5.50 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G404  $             6.20  PLASTIC TRENDS G404

127. 659.17.G504 45D 4"BELL X 4"BELL SDR-35 -$                      0 0 5.20$              

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G504  $            6.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G504  $             7.00  PLASTIC TRENDS G504

128. 659.17.G508 45D 8"BELL X 8"BELL SDR-35 -$                      0 0 29.82$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G508  $          35.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G508  $           39.60  PLASTIC TRENDS G508

129. 659.27.EC-4

FAST CAP 4"ID X 1.25" PVC/CI 

SDR35 -$                      0 0 2.17$      DS 4-DAL-CAP 1.68$              

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  EC-4  $            2.00  FERNCO  QC 104  $             2.15  FERNCO QC-104

130. 659.33.G6210

10" BELL~BELL SDR35 W/O 

STOP -$                      0 0 48.20$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G6210  $          55.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G6210  $           65.00  PLASTIC TRENDS G6210

131. 659.33.G6212

12" BELL~BELL SDR35 W/O 

STOP -$                      0 0 70.00$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G6212  $          80.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G6212  $           94.00  PLASTIC TRENDS G6212

132. 659.33.G624 4" BELL~BELL SDR35 W/O STOP -$                      0 0 6.45$              

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G624  $            8.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G624  $             8.60  PLASTIC TRENDS G624

133. 659.33.G626 6" BELL~BELL SDR35 W/O STOP -$                      0 0 12.60$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G626  $          16.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G626  $           17.20  PLASTIC TRENDS G626

134. 659.33.G628 8" BELL~BELL SDR35 W/O STOP -$                      0 0 21.62$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G628  $          28.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G628  $           29.00  PLASTIC TRENDS G628

135. 659.33.T624

4" BELL~BELL IPS SDR26 DWV 

CL160 -$                      0 0 12.25$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  T624  $          13.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  T624  $           14.20  PLASTIC TRENDS T624

136. 659.33.T628

8" BELL~BELL IPS SDR26 DWV 

CL160 -$                      0 0 29.35$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  T628  $          45.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  T628  $           29.60  PLASTIC TRENDS T628

137. 659.33.109-040 4" BELL~BELL IPS CL200 SDR21 -$                      0 0 22.00$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  109-040  $          27.00  HARCO  109-040  $           43.50  HARCO 109-040

138. 659.33.109-080 8" BELL~BELL IPS CL200 SDR21 -$                      0 0 73.20$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  109-080  $          96.00  HARCO  109-080  $         157.00  HARCO 109-080

139. 659.54.T1164

4" SPIGOT IPS SDR26 DWV 

CL160 -$                      0 0 9.00$              

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  T1164  $          11.50 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  T1164  $           13.30  PLASTIC TRENDS T1164

140. 659.54.40040 4"-W/WING NUT -$                      0 0 4.45$              

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  270-245  $            6.00  CHERNE  270-245  $             6.80  CHERNE 270-245

141. 659.54.40060 6"-W/WING NUT -$                      0 0 12.45$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  270-261  $          15.00  CHERNE  270-261  $           18.30  CHERNE 270-261

142. 659.54.40080 8"-W/WING NUT -$                      0 0 23.60$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  270-270  $          27.00  CHERNE  270-270  $           33.60  CHERNE 270-270

143. 659.54.P1154 4"MIP-W/MALE SQU DRIVE -$                      0 0 4.35$              

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  P1154  $            2.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  P1154  $             2.00  PLASTIC TRENDS P1154

144. 659.54.TEMP4 4" TEMP PLUG POLYETHYLENE -$                      0 0 2.18$              

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G1184  $            3.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G1184  $             3.00  PLASTIC TRENDS G1184

145. 659.54.TEMP6 6" TEMP PLUG POLYETHYLENE -$                      0 0 12.95$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G1186  $            4.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G1186  $             4.40  PLASTIC TRENDS G1186

146. 659.85.T1658-4

SANITARY 8" X 4" IPS CL160 

SDR26 -$                      0 0 89.50$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  16-0500804  $        110.00  HARCO  16-0500804  NO-BID 

147. 659.85.112-840

STRAIGHT 8" X 4" IPS CL200 

SDR21 -$                      0 0 172.00$          

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  112-840  $        175.00  HARCO  112-840  $         295.00  HARCO 112-840

148. 659.85.G108-4 STRAIGHT 8" X 4" BELL SDR35 -$                      0 0 27.05$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G108.4  $          32.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G108.4  $           36.60  PLASTIC TRENDS G108-4

149. 659.85.G157 SANITARY 6" X 6" BELL SDR35 -$                      0 0 25.00$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G157  $          30.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G157  $           34.00  PLASTIC TRENDS G157

150. 659.85.G157-4 SANITARY 6" X 4" BELL SDR35 -$                      0 0 21.60$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G157-4  $          25.75 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G157-4  $           29.00  PLASTIC TRENDS G157-4
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151. 659.85.G158-4 SANITARY 8" X 4" BELL SDR35 -$                      0 0 26.25$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G158-4  $          34.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G158-4  $           38.40  PLASTIC TRENDS G158-4

152. 659.85.T1108-4

8" BELL X 4" BELL IPS DWV 

CL160 -$                      0 0 57.45$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  16-100804  $          70.00  HARCO  16-100804  NO-BID 

153. 659.94.G306 6" X 6" BELL SDR35 -$                      0 0 20.00$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G306  $          25.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G306  $           27.60  PLASTIC TRENDS G306

154. 659.94.G306-4 6" X 4" BELL SDR35 -$                      0 0 18.42$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G306-4  $          21.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G306-4  $           24.40  PLASTIC TRENDS G306-4

155. 659.94.G308-4 8" X 4" BELL SDR35 -$                      0 0 36.85$            

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G308-4  $          32.00 

 PLASTIC 

TRENDS  G308-4  $           36.40  PLASTIC TRENDS G308-4

156. 658.60.2INSERT 2"SS CTS INSERT -$                      0 0 1.68$               EGW  INSERT-55  $            1.75  FORD  INSERT-55  $             5.40  MUELLER 0

157. 659.85.WWAC

WASTE WATER ACCESS 

CHAMBER 6"-12" -$                      0 0 475.00$          

 JM 

EAGLE/GPK  WAC-15  $        520.00 

 JM 

MANUFACTUR

ING  WAC-15  $         540.00  JM WAC-15

TOOLS TOTAL

158. 445.06.DT100 DRILL/TAP-1"XCC -$                      0 0 168.00$           MUELLER  DT100  $        170.00  REED  DT100  $         225.00  REED DT100

159. 445.06.TMTC DRILL/TAP LUBE -$                      0 0 20.57$             MUELLER  TMTC  $          21.00  REED  TMTC  $           29.00  REED TMTC

160. 890.45.KEYLG

45D METER BOX KEY / CORP 

WRENCH -$                      0 0 30.00$             b&k   b151-064  $          30.00  B & K  151-064  NO-BID 

161. 890.45.KEYSM

METER BOX KEY BRASS W/TEE 

HANDLE -$                      0 0 10.00$             BASS-HAYS  BKEY52  $          10.00  ACCUCAST  MBK  $           12.00  BASS & HAYS 52

162. 890.45.MKDT

METER BOX KEY W/HAMMER 

HEAD -$                      0 0 9.00$               REED  R02375  $          10.00  REED  MKDT  $           10.00  REED MKDT

163. 832.62.PIPETAPE1

PVC PIPE WRAP 2"X 100FT X 

10MIL -$                      0 0 4.99$               PRO-SELECT  PSPWT210  $            4.50  ACCUCAST  2PW100  $             5.00  $                           -   0

WATER METER INSTALLATION PARTS TOTAL

164. 890.45.H10889-075100 3/4" F/M METER  X  1"M METER -$                      0 0 6.80$               MUELLER  H10889-3/4"X1".  $            6.50  FORD 

 A34NL $6.50ea 

$13pr  $             6.83  MUELLER 0

165. 890.45.H10890-075 3/4"MIP X 3/4"METER -$                      0 0 5.17$      TMP MC-3/4 6.28$               MUELLER  H10890-3/4".  $            6.70  FORD  C382325NL  $             6.32  MUELLER 0

166. 890.45.H10890-100 1"MIP X 1" METER -$                      0 0 7.17$      TMP MC-1 9.58$               MUELLER  H-10890-1".  $          10.30  FORD  C38442625NL  $             9.72  MUELLER 0

167. 890.45.H10892-075 90D 3/4"MIP X 3/4"METER -$                      0 0 11.17$    TMP MC-3/4-90 9.65$               MUELLER  H-10892-3/4"  $            9.70  FORD  L38.23NL  $             9.72  MUELLER 0

168. 890.45.H10892-100 90D 1"MIP X 1" METER -$                      0 0 19.17$    TMP MC-190 13.80$             MUELLER  H10892-1"  $          13.80  FORD  L3844NL  $           13.88  MUELLER 0

169. 890.45.H14118-058075 RESETTER- 5/8" X 3/4". -$                      0 0 61.52$             MUELLER  H14118 - 5/8 X 3/4  $          61.60  FORD  V427WNL  $           61.75  MUELLER 0

170. 890.45.H14118-100 RESETTER - 1". -$                      0 0 117.32$           MUELLER  H14118 1"  $        118.00  FORD  V4410WNL  $         120.00  MUELLER 0

171. 890.45.H14255-100 1" FLARE X 1" MTR X 90D -$                      0 0 77.98$             MUELLER  H14255-100  $          53.00  FORD  BA23444WNL  $           38.75  MUELLER 0

172. 890.45.B24258-075

BALL STOP 90D 3/4" CTS X 3/4 

MTR -$                      0 0 45.85$             MUELLER 

 B24258-5/8X3/4 X 3/4 

CTS   $          53.00  FORD  BA43332WQNL  $           53.30  MUELLER 0

173. 890.45.B24258-100 BALL STOP 90D 1" CTS X 1" MTR -$                      0 0 68.50$             MUELLER  B24258 - 1"  $          79.00  FORD  BA43444WQNL  $           80.00  MUELLER 0

174. 890.45.B24265-075

BALL STOP 90D 3/4"FIP X 5/8" 

MTR -$                      0 0 45.90$             MUELLER 

 B24265-

5/8X3/4X3/4FIP  $          46.00  FORD  BA13332WNL  $           46.20  MUELLER 0

175. 890.45.B24265-100 BALL STOP 90D 1"FIP X 1"MTR -$                      0 0 69.45$             MUELLER  B24265 - 1"  $          69.50  FORD  BA13444WNL  $           69.60  MUELLER 0

176. 890.45.B24276-150

BALL STOP 1-1/2" CTS X 1-1/2" 

MTR FLG 90D -$                      0 0 166.50$           MUELLER  B24276-1-1/2"  $        180.00  FORD  BFA43666WQNL  $         167.00  MUELLER 0

177. 890.45.B24276-200

BALL STOP 2" CTS X 2" MTR 

FLG 90D -$                      0 0 210.50$           MUELLER  B24276-2"  $        228.00  FORD  BFA777WQNL  $         212.80  MUELLER 0

178. 890.45.H15381-2001

SERVICE TEE 2" CTS X 2" CTS X 

1" C -$                      0 0  NO-BID  $        120.00  FORD  T444-774QNL  $         177.40  MUELLER 0

179. 890.45.B25008-075

BALL STOP 3/4"CTS X 3/4" CC 

THREAD -$                      0 0 32.65$             MUELLER  B25008-3/4"  $          32.80  FORD  FB10003QNL  $           32.80  MUELLER 0

180. 890.45.B25008-100

BALL STOP 1"CTS X 1"CC 

THREAD -$                      0 0 42.95$             MUELLER  B25008-1".  $          43.00  FORD  FB10004QNL  $           43.20  MUELLER 0

181. 890.45.H15363-075

3/4"CTS X 3/4"MIP X 3/4" MIP X 7-

1/2". -$                      0 0 25.85$             MUELLER 

 H15363-3/4"X3/4"X7-

1/2  $          75.00  FORD  UV4332WNL  $           26.60  MUELLER 0

182. 890.45.H15403-075 3/4"CTS X 3/4"CTS -$                      0 0 12.45$             MUELLER  H15403-3/4".  $          12.50  FORD  C4433QNL  $           12.70  MUELLER 0

183. 890.45.H15403-075100 3/4"CTS X 1"CTS -$                      0 0 13.85$             MUELLER  H15403-3/4"X1".  $          14.50  FORD  C4434QNL  $           14.00  MUELLER 0

184. 890.45.H15403-100 1"CTS X 1"CTS -$                      0 0 13.70$             MUELLER  H15403-1".  $          14.00  FORD  C4444QNL  $           13.80  MUELLER 0

185. 890.45.H15403-125 1-1/4"CTS X 1-1/4"CTS -$                      0 0 13.65$             MUELLER  H15403-1-1/4".  $          25.00  FORD  C4455QNL  $           39.60  MUELLER 0

186. 890.45.H15403-150 1-1/2"CTS X 1-1/2"CTS -$                      0 0 41.25$             MUELLER  H15403-1-1/2".  $          48.00  FORD  C4466QNL  $           48.80  MUELLER 0

187. 890.45.H15403-200 2"CTS X 2"CTS -$                      0 0 64.45$             MUELLER  H15403-2".  $          64.50  FORD  C4477QNL  $           65.90  MUELLER 0

188. 890.45.H15428-075 3/4"CTS X 3/4"MIP -$                      0 0 64.00$             MUELLER  H15428-3/4".  $          10.30  FORD  C8433QNL  $           10.40  MUELLER 0

189. 890.45.H15428-100 1"CTS X 1"MIP -$                      0 0 10.22$             MUELLER  H15428-1".  $          12.20  FORD  C8444QNL  $           12.30  MUELLER 0

190. 890.45.H15428-100075 1"CTS X 3/4"MIP -$                      0 0 12.05$             MUELLER  H15428-1"X3/4".  $          11.20  FORD  C8434QNL  $           10.70  MUELLER 0

191. 890.45.H15428-150 1-1/2"CTS X 1-1/2"MIP -$                      0 0 10.28$             MUELLER  H15428-1-1/2".  $          33.50  FORD  C8466QNL  $           34.00  MUELLER 0

192. 890.45.H15428-200 2"CTS X 2"MIP -$                      0 0 33.25$             MUELLER  H15428-2".  $          48.00  FORD  C8477QNL  $           49.50  MUELLER 0

193. 890.45.H15429-075 3/4"IPS X 3/4"MIP -$                      0 0 47.90$             MUELLER  H15429-3/4".  $          13.50  FORD  C8633QNL  $           12.70  MUELLER 0

194. 890.45.H15429-100 1"IPS X 1"MIP -$                      0 0 12.62$             MUELLER  H15429-1".  $          19.80  FORD  C8644NL  $           20.00  MUELLER 0

195. 890.45.H15451-075 3/4"CTS X 3/4"FIP -$                      0 0 19.70$             MUELLER  H15451-3/4".  $          11.00  FORD  C1433QNL  $           11.15  MUELLER 0

196. 890.45.H15451-075100 3/4"CTS X 1"FIP -$                      0 0 10.73$             MUELLER  H15451-3/4"X1".  $          12.90  FORD  C1443QNL  $           13.00  MUELLER 0

197. 890.45.H15451-100 1"CTS X 1"FIP -$                      0 0 12.79$             MUELLER  H15451-1".  $          14.70  FORD  C1444QNL  $           15.90  MUELLER 0

198. 890.45.H15451-100075 1"CTS X 3/4"FIP -$                      0 0 15.25$             MUELLER  H15451-1"X3/4".  $          12.70  FORD  C1434QNL  $           12.90  MUELLER 0

199. 890.45.H15451-125 1-1/4"CTS X 1-1/4"FIP -$                      0 0 18.90$             MUELLER  H15451-1-1/4".  $          27.00  FORD  C1455QNL  $           19.30  MUELLER 0

200. 890.45.H15451-150 1-1/2"CTS X 1-1/2"FIP -$                      0 0 42.61$             MUELLER  H15451  1-1/2".  $          42.70  FORD  C1466QNL  $           43.50  MUELLER 0

201. 890.45.H15451-200 2"CTS X 2"FIP -$                      0 0 50.71$             MUELLER  H15451-2".  $          50.80  FORD  C1477QNL  $           51.80  MUELLER 0

202. 890.45.H15454-100 1"IPS X 1"FIP -$                      0 0 16.95$             MUELLER  H-15454  1".  $          17.00  FORD  C1644QNL  $           17.50  MUELLER 0

203. 890.45.H15526-075 90D 3/4"CTS X 3/4"CTS -$                      0 0 15.50$             MUELLER  H15526-3/4"  $          16.20  FORD  L4433QNL  $           15.60  MUELLER 0

204. 890.45.H15526-100 90D 1"CTS X 1"CTS -$                      0 0 19.85$             MUELLER  H15526-1".  $          20.50  FORD  L4444QNL  $           20.00  MUELLER 0

205. 890.45.H15526-150 90D 1-1/2"CTS X 1-1/2"CTS -$                      0 0 66.20$             MUELLER  H15526-1-1/2"  $          67.00  FORD  L4466QNL  $           68.00  MUELLER 0

206. 890.45.H15526-200 90D 2"CTS X 2"CTS -$                      0 0 135.00$           MUELLER  H15526-2"  $        135.00  FORD  L4477QNL  $         137.70  MUELLER 0
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207. 890.45.H15531-075 90D 3/4"CTS X 3/4"MIP -$                      0 0 10.70$             MUELLER  H15531-3/4"  $          11.20  FORD  L8433QNL  $           10.80  MUELLER 0

208. 890.45.H15531-100 90D 1"CTS X 1"MIP -$                      0 0 18.60$             MUELLER  H15531-1"  $          18.60  FORD  L8444QNL  $           18.70  MUELLER 0

209. 890.45.H15531-150 90D 1-1/2"CTS X 1-1/2"MIP -$                      0 0 54.35$             MUELLER  H15531-1-1/2"  $          54.50  FORD  L8466QNL  $           55.50  MUELLER 0

210. 890.45.H15531-200 90D 2"CTS X 2"MIP -$                      0 0 77.95$             MUELLER  H15531-2"  $          78.00  FORD  L8477QNL  $           79.50  MUELLER 0

211. 890.45.H15533-075 90D 3/4"CTS X 3/4"FIP -$                      0 0 15.50$             MUELLER  H15533  3/4"  $          15.00  FORD  L1433QNL  $           16.00  MUELLER 0

212. 890.45.H15533-100 90D 1"CTS X 1"FIP -$                      0 0 23.71$             MUELLER  H15533-1".  $          23.80  FORD  L1444QNL  $           24.10  MUELLER 0

213. 890.45.H15533-150 90D 1-1/2"CTS X 1-1/2"FIP -$                      0 0 60.18$             MUELLER  H15533  1-1/2".  $          60.20  FORD  L1466QNL  $           61.40  MUELLER 0

214. 890.45.H15533-200 90D 2"CTS X 2"FIP -$                      0 0 67.60$             MUELLER  H15533-2".  $          85.00  FORD  L1477QNL  $           67.70  MUELLER 0

BRASS, NO LEAD TOTAL

215. 659.65.BL025050 BELL 1/4" X 1/2" -$                      0 0 1.84$               FERGUSON 

 1/4" X 1/2" BRASS 

BELL  $            1.80  MATCO 

 1/4" X 1/2" BRASS 

BELL  $             2.35  MATCO 0

216. 659.65.BL025375 BELL 1/4" X 3/8" -$                      0 0 1.50$               FERGUSON 

 1/4" X 3/8" BRASS 

BELL  $            1.50  MATCO 

 1/4" X 3/8" BRASS 

BELL  $             1.90  MATCO 0

217. 659.65.BL050075 BELL 1/2" X 3/4" -$                      0 0 2.67$               FERGUSON 

 1/2" X 3/4" BRASS 

BELL  $            2.50  MATCO 

 1/2" X 3/4" BRASS 

BELL  $             3.50  MATCO 0

218. 659.65.BL075100 BELL 3/4" X 1" -$                      0 0 4.33$               FERGUSON  3/4" X 1" BRASS BELL  $            4.50  MATCO 

 3/4" X 1" BRASS 

BELL  $             5.80  MATCO 0

219. 659.65.BSH100075 HEX BUSHING 1.00" X 0.75" -$                      0 0 2.24$               FERGUSON 

 1" X 3/4" HEX 

BUSHING  $            2.20  MATCO 

 1" X 3/4" HEX 

BUSHING  $             2.90  MATCO 0

220. 659.65.BSH200100 HEX BUSHING 2.00 X 1.00" -$                      0 0 8.28$               FERGUSON  2" X 1" HEX BUSHING  $            8.70  MATCO 

 2" X 1" HEX 

BUSHING  $           11.20  MATCO 0

221. 659.65.BSH200150 HEX BUSHING 2.00" X 1.50" -$                      0 0 6.90$               FERGUSON 

 2" X 1-1/2" HEX 

BSHNG  $            7.50  MATCO 

 2" X 1-1/2" HEX 

BSHNG  $             9.30  MATCO 0

222. 659.85.TEE075 3/4" FNPT X 3 -$                      0 0 3.27$               FERGUSON  3/4" BRASS TEE  $            3.50  MATCO  3/4" BRASS TEE  $             4.40  MATCO 0

223. 659.85.TEE100 1" FNPT X 3 -$                      0 0 5.80$               FERGUSON  1" BRASS TEE  $            6.00  MATCO  1" BRASS TEE  $             7.80  MATCO 0

224. 659.85.TEE150 1-1/2" FNPT X 3 -$                      0 0 11.05$             FERGUSON  1-1/2" BRASS TEE  $          11.50  MATCO  1-1/2" BRASS TEE  $           15.00  MATCO 0

225. 659.85.TEE200 2" FNPT X 3 -$                      0 0 18.01$             FERGUSON  2" BRASS TEE  $          19.00  MATCO  2" BRASS TEE  $           24.70  MATCO 0

226. 659.33.CPL075 0.75" FNPT -$                      0 0 2.24$               FERGUSON  3/4" COUPLING  $            2.30  MATCO  3/4" COUPLING  $             2.90  MATCO 0

227. 659.33.CPL100 1.00" FNPT -$                      0 0 3.33$               FERGUSON  1" COUPLING  $            3.40  MATCO  1" COUPLING  $             4.40  MATCO 0

228. 659.33.CPL150 1.50" FNPT -$                      0 0 6.90$               FERGUSON  1-1/2" COUPLING  $            7.20  MATCO  1-1/2" COUPLING  $             9.30  MATCO 0

229. 659.33.CPL200 2.00" FNPT -$                      0 0 11.26$             FERGUSON  2" COUPLING  $          12.50  MATCO  2" COUPLING  $           15.40  MATCO 0

230. 890.45.ELF90-075 90D 3/4" FNPT -$                      0 0 3.52$               FERGUSON  3/4" 90D ELBOW  $            2.80  MATCO  3/4" 90D ELBOW  $             3.50  MATCO 0

231. 890.45.ELF90-100 90D 1" FNPT -$                      0 0 5.72$               FERGUSON  1" 90D ELBOW  $            4.30  MATCO  1" 90D ELBOW  $             5.50  MATCO 0

232. 890.45.ELF90-150 90D 1-1/2" FNPT -$                      0 0 11.16$             FERGUSON  1-1/2" 90D ELBOW  $            9.00  MATCO  1-1/2" 90D ELBOW  $           11.00  MATCO 0

233. 890.45.ELF90-200 90D 2" FNPT -$                      0 0 13.05$             FERGUSON  2" 90D ELBOW  $          14.00  MATCO  2" 90D ELBOW  $           17.80  MATCO 0

234. 659.54.H10033-075

3/4" AWWA TAPER MUELLER CC 

THREAD -$                      0 0 5.46$               FERGUSON  H10033-075  $            6.00  FORD  H10033-075  $             8.80  MATCO 0

235. 659.54.H10033-100

1" AWWA TAPER MUELLER CC 

THREAD -$                      0 0 7.88$               FERGUSON  H10033-100  $            9.00  FORD  H10033-100  $             9.30  MATCO 0

236. 659.54.PLG075 3/4" MNPT W/HXHD -$                      0 0 1.66$               FERGUSON  3/4 HEX PLUG  $            1.70  MATCO  3/4 HEX PLUG  NO-BID 

237. 659.54.PLG100 1" MNPT W/SQU DR -$                      0 0 2.15$               FERGUSON  1"SQU DR PLUG  $            2.20  MATCO  1"SQU DR PLUG  $             2.80  MATCO 0

238. 659.54.PLG150 1-1/2" MNPT W/SQU DR -$                      0 0 3.84$               FERGUSON  1-1/2" SQU DR PLUG  $            4.00  MATCO 

 1-1/2" SQU DR 

PLUG  $             5.20  MATCO 0

239. 659.54.PLG200 2" MNPT W/SQU DR -$                      0 0 6.12$               FERGUSON  2" SQU DR PLUG  $            7.00  MATCO  2" SQU DR PLUG  $             8.20  MATCO 0

240. 659.54.PLG350 3-1/2" MNPT W/MALE SQU DR -$                      0 0 6.59$               FERGUSON  3-1/2" SQU DR PLUG  $            7.00  MATCO 

 3-1/2" SQU DR 

PLUG  NO-BID 

241. 659.54.PLG350FMD

3-1/2" MNPT W/FM SQU DR 

PLUG -$                      0 0 6.59$               FERGUSON 

 3-1/2" FM SQU DR 

PLUG  $            7.00  MATCO 

 3-1/2" FM SQU DR 

PLUG  NO-BID 

242. 659.54.PLG400 4"MNPT W/MALE SQU DR -$                      0 0 6.45$               FERGUSON  4" SQU DR PLUG  $            7.00  MATCO  4" SQU DR PLUG  $           44.20  MATCO 0

243. 659.54.PLG400FMD 4"MNPT W/FM SQU DR -$                      0 0 6.45$               FERGUSON  4" FM SQU DR PLUG  $            7.00  MATCO 

 4" FM SQU DR 

PLUG  $           44.20  MATCO 0

244. 659.50.NPL075075 3/4" NPT X CLOSED -$                      0 0 1.31$               FERGUSON  3/4XCL NIPPLE  $            1.30  MATCO  3/4XCL NIPPLE  $             1.65  MATCO 0

245. 659.50.NPL075200 3/4" NPT X 2" LONG -$                      0 0 1.61$               FERGUSON  3/4X2 NIPPLE  $            1.60  MATCO  3/4X2 NIPPLE  $             2.05  MATCO 0

246. 659.50.NPL075400 3/4" NPT X 4" LONG -$                      0 0 2.69$               FERGUSON  3/4X4 NIPPLE  $            2.80  MATCO  3/4X4 NIPPLE  $             3.50  MATCO 0

247. 659.50.NPL075600 3/4" NPT X 6" LONG -$                      0 0 3.87$               FERGUSON  3/4X6 NIPPLE  $            4.00  MATCO  3/4X6 NIPPLE  $             5.20  MATCO 0

248. 659.50.NPL100100 1" NPT X CLOSED -$                      0 0 1.86$               FERGUSON  1XCL NIPPLE  $            1.80  MATCO  1XCL NIPPLE  $             2.40  MATCO 0

249. 659.50.NPL100200 1" NPT X 2" LONG -$                      0 0 2.26$               FERGUSON  1" NPT X 2" LONG  $            2.30  MATCO  1X2 NIPPLE  $             3.00  MATCO 0

250. 659.50.NPL100400 1" NPT X 4" LONG -$                      0 0 3.83$               FERGUSON  1" NPT X 4" LONG  $            4.00  MATCO  1X4 NIPPLE  $             5.20  MATCO 0

251. 659.50.NPL100600 1" NPT X 6" LONG -$                      0 0 5.57$               FERGUSON  1" NPT X 6" LONG  $            5.80  MATCO  1X6 NIPPLE  $             7.60  MATCO 0

252. 659.50.NPL150150 1-1/2" NPT X CLOSED -$                      0 0 3.50$               FERGUSON  1-1/2" NPT X CLOSED  $            3.50  MATCO  1-1/2X CL NIPPLE  $             4.70  MATCO 0

253. 659.50.NPL150200 1-1/2" NPT X 2" LONG -$                      0 0 3.75$               FERGUSON  1-1/2" NPT X 2" LONG  $            3.80  MATCO  1-1/2X2 NIPPLE  $             5.10  MATCO 0

254. 659.50.NPL150400 1-1/2" NPT X 4" LONG -$                      0 0 6.61$               FERGUSON  1-1/2" NPT X 4" LONG  $            5.00  MATCO  1-1/2X4 NIPPLE  $             9.10  MATCO 0

255. 659.50.NPL150600 1-1/2" NPT X 6"LONG -$                      0 0 10.10$             FERGUSON  1-1/2X 6 NIPPLE  $          10.00  MATCO  1-1/2X 6 NIPPLE  $           13.40  MATCO 0

256. 659.50.NPL150800 1-1/2" NPT X 8"LONG -$                      0 0 12.82$             FERGUSON  1-1/2X8 NIPPLE  $          13.50  MATCO  1-1/2X8 NIPPLE  $           17.80  MATCO 0

257. 659.50.NPL200200 2"NPT X CLOSED -$                      0 0 5.25$               FERGUSON  2XCL NIPPLE  $            5.50  MATCO  2XCL NIPPLE  $             7.20  MATCO 0

258. 659.50.NPL200400 2" NPT X 4"LONG -$                      0 0 8.46$               FERGUSON  2X4 NIPPLE  $            9.00  MATCO  2X4 NIPPLE  $           11.70  MATCO 0

259. 659.50.NPL200600 2" NPT X 6" LONG -$                      0 0 12.42$             FERGUSON  2X6 NIPPLE  $          13.00  MATCO  2X6 NIPPLE  $           17.30  MATCO 0

260. 659.50.NPL200800 2" NPT X 8" LONG -$                      0 0 16.52$             FERGUSON  2X8 NIPPLE  $          17.40  MATCO  2X8 NIPPLE  $           23.00  MATCO 0
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